Professional Regulation Commission                                                              The Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (PRBoA)
Manila                                                                                                                                          Office of the Acting PRBoA Chairman
PRBoA Position on Documents Officially Issued (or Supposedly Approved) by the DPWH, and Which Have Apparently Been in Continued Use by the LGUs to Contravene the Special Law Governing the Preparation, Signing and Sealing of Architectural Documents
29 October 2010                                                                 page 21 of 28    

[image: image2.jpg]\‘Rr-_GU LAT/o,
N \Co




                                                         Republic of the Philippines

                        Professional Regulation Commission

                                                        Manila

________________________________________________________________________________________________________________

[image: image3.jpg]


The Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (PRBoA)

Office of the Acting PRBoA Chairman

Email Address: prboa.prc.gov.ph@gmail.com
URL/ website: www.architectureboard.ph
        Mobiles: 0928.3695508  0922.8415161  0916.3822826 
                   Telefax: c/o 02.454.7592 and Fax: c/o 02.286.2678
________________________________________________________________________________________________________________

Your Ref:


           Our Ref : 10oct29_PRBoA-471
29 October 2010

Republic of the Philippines

Province of _____________
LGU of The City/ Municipality of _____________
The Office of the Mayor

ATTENTION
:
The Hon. ______________________



The Mayor



The Hon. Vice Mayor and 



The Hon. Members of the Sangguniang Panlungsod/ Bayan (The City/ Municipal Council)



The Administrator 



The Legal Officer 



The Treasurer 



The Planning and Development Officer 



The Engineer (in his official capacity as The Acting Building Official) 



The Fire Marshal 

[image: image4.jpg]



SUBJECT
:
PRBoA Position on Documents Officially Issued (or Supposedly Approved) by the DPWH, and Which Have Apparently Been in Continued Use by the LGUs to Contravene the Special Law Governing the Preparation, Signing and Sealing of Architectural Documents
References
:
1)
DPWH Memorandum Circular No. 02, dated 16 September 2009 signed by then DPWH Secretary Hermogenes E. Ebdane, Jr., which allows civil engineers (CEs) to continue to sign and seal architectural documents that form part of building plans and specifications submitted to the LGU Offices of Building Officials (OBOs) to secure building permits, contrary to law [specifically with respect to the multiple provisions of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) that LIMIT to registered and licensed architects (RLAs) the professional privilege of preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents]; and
_____________________________________________________________________________________________

Office of the Secretary (AsSec) to the Professional Regulatory Boards (PRBs), 3/F Professional Regulation Commission (PRC) Main Building, PRC Compound, P. Paredes St., cor. N. Reyes St., Sampaloc 1008,  Manila, PH,   P.O. Box 2038   Manila  Tel.02.735.1533  (c/o Mrs. Myrna Taruc) or  c/o  02.314.0018     PRBoA Telefax : c/o 02.454.7592 (c/o Mr. Nib Alamil) and PRBoA Fax :  c/o  02.286.2678


2)
intercalated version of P.D. No. 1096 (The 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP and its 2004 Revised IRR) published, marketed and openly sold at a popular bookstore, purporting that the same is the version officially approved by the DPWH, with its Sec. 302 (of P.D. No. 1096) also purporting that CEs can sign and seal architectural documents (when the authentic text of the law P.D. No. 1096 does not say the same), and with its deletion of the authentic Sec. 304.5.b of the P.D. No. 1096 2004 Revised IRR, all contrary to law; Sec. 304.5.b of the P.D. No. 1096 2004 Revised IRR is the specific provision requiring LGU OBO compliance with professional regulatory laws (PRLs) such as R.A. No. 9266, in the implementation of the said P.D. No. 1096 2004 Revised IRR
Dear Sirs/ Mesdames,


Warm greetings from the Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (the “PRBoA”).  


It has been 4 months since Your assumption of office and the PRBoA believes that it is now the opportune time for Your LGU (under Your able and principled guidance, and under the mandates of genuine public service and fairness to all, that are constantly cited by our dear Chief Executive), to finally and decisively address the nearly seven (7) decades of continuing injustice foisted on Philippine Architects, quite possibly by the State itself, particularly through the Department of Public Works and Highways (DPWH) and the Local Government Units (LGUs).

The PRBoA specifically refers to the apparently continuing and largely unabated DPWH-sponsored and LGU-promoted practices of allowing civil engineers (CEs) to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents (and of the official processing and approval by the Government of such improper and potentially illegal documents), despite the very clear and unequivocal dictates of law that specifically limit such acts (and professional privileges) to Architects registered and licensed by the State. 

[image: image5.jpg]



Despite numerous Memoranda, nationally-published Public Notices and official communications emanating from the PRBoA over the years 2005 to date, the LGUs, with the official prodding of the DPWH, still continue to engage in such questioned practices, in clear violation of law.

I.
The Current Situation’s Overall Effect on the Natural and Built Environments and on Public Welfare and Safety


The concerned CEs, not being knowledgeable in the nuances of architectural practice and largely incompetent in the preparation of architectural documents (as the said CEs have not been academically/ sub-professionally prepared nor tested by the State for such technical capabilities), apparently merely rely on non-professionals i.e. impressionable B.S. Architecture undergraduates and even failed takers of the licensure examination for architects (LEA), to prepare such architectural documents, for later signing and sealing by the said concerned CEs. Some of these CEs openly admit that they engage draftsmen with architectural training/ backgrounds in the preparation of building plans/ designs i.e. quite possibly inclusive of plans/ designs with architectural content.


Such a State-permitted situation has apparently resulted in incalculable instances of knowing/ unknowing violations of, or clearly failed attempts at compliances with many development- and/or building-related laws (national and local) and their respective IRRs, thereby unduly/ unnecessarily compromising public health, safety and welfare, to wit:

1) P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as The 1997 National Building Code of the Philippines (NBCP); 
2) B.P. No. 344, otherwise known as The Law on Accessibility for the Disabled, 
3) The Sanitation Code;

4) The Water Code; 
5) R.A. No. 9514, otherwise known as The 2008 Fire Code of the Philippines (formerly P.D. No. 1185);

6) LGU Zoning Ordinances (ZOs); 
7) various environmental laws;
8) R.A. No. 9184, otherwise known as The Government Procurement Reform Act (GPRA) of 2004; 
9) P.D. No. 957 (governing the planning and design of subdivisions and condominiums); 
10) B.P. No. 220 (governing the planning and design of socialized housing projects); and

11) R.A. No. 9266 itself (The Architecture Act of 2004), a special and later law governing the practice of the separate State-regulated profession of architecture in the Philippines.  


With the advent of extreme events coupled with man-induced exacerbation of such natural disasters/ occurrences, the potentially inevitable loss of lives and damage to properties arising from improperly crafted architectural documents may also result.

II.
R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) Has Been in FULL Effect Since 10 April 2004 

To date (or more than 6 years after becoming the new Law on the practice of Architecture in the Philippines), there is NO TRO, NO injunction and NO pending constitutional question whatsoever on ANY of the provisions of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) or of its 2004 IRR or of PRBoA issuances such as Resolutions since 2004, particularly the ones that LIMIT to registered and licensed architects (RLAs) the professional privilege of preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents. 

[image: image6.jpg]Note: This page comes from the certified rue copy (CTC) of Presidential Decree
{PD) 1096, othenvise known as the National Suilding Code, as signed by Pres.
Marcos and Sec. Tuvera on 17 Febraary 1977. i forms part ofthe kull CTC set of
PD 1096 as issued by the Malacanang Records Office in iafe July 2005. Please
‘note thet neither the ord arcitect nor civil engineer is mentioned in Sec. 302.

-9 =
CHAPTER 3

PERMITS AND INSPECTION

SECTION 301. Building Permits

No person, firm or corporation, including any agency
or instrumentality of the government shall erect. construct,
alter, repair, move, convert or demolish any building or
structure or cause the same to be done without first obtain-
ing a building permit therefor from the Building Official
assigned in the place where the subject building is located
or the building work is to be done.

SECTION 302. Application for permits

In order to obtain a building permit, the applicant

shall file an application therefor
prescribed form from the Office of
Every application shall provide at
information:

(1)

permit applied for;

(2)

on

in writing and on the
the Building Official.
least the following

A description of the work to be covered by the

Certified true copy of the TCT covering the lot
which the proposed work is to be done.

If the applicant

not the registered owner, in addition to the TCT, a copy

occupancy for which the propusal work

is

of the contract of lease shall be submitted;
(3) The use or

is intended;
(4) Estimated cost of the proposed work.

To be submitted together with

least five sets of corresponding plans and specifications
signed and sealed by a duly mechanical engineer
and by a registered electrical

prepared,
in case of mechanical plans,

such application are at

<

engineer in case of electrical plans, except in those cases
exempted or not required by the Building Official under this
Code.



R.A. No. 9266 is a special, later, valid and subsisting law (reference Attachments A and B) that MUST be satisfactorily complied with/ implemented by ALL Government officials (reference R.A. No. 9266 Secs. 20.(2) & (5), 29 and 44.), specifically including LGU officials such as the Mayors, Vice Mayors, Councilmen, Administrators, Legal Officers, Planning Officers, Treasurers and Building Officials and their staff (the last of which are supposedly under the administrative control of the DPWH), under pain of sanctions and administrative/ criminal liability, particularly under its Sec. 29.
While Sec. 43 of R.A. No. 9266 states that the law shall not be construed to affect or prevent the practice of any other legally-recognized profession such as civil engineering, it is also very important to remember that the CE law clearly distinguishes the practices of the CE and the Architect and that the CE registration and license is not/ never for the practice of 2 distinct State-regulated professions. Otherwise, why would there have been need to pass separate laws for Architecture (R.A. No. 545) and civil engineering (R.A. No. 544) in June 1950 (and then amend both laws in June 1956 to further distinguish the 2 practices i.e. R.A. No. 1581 for Architects and R.A. No. 1582 for the CEs). 
More specifically, the 60-year old CE law (which to date still does not have a codified set of IRR which could aptly define the CE version of the terms “building” or “building plans and specifications”), never mentions that CEs can prepare, sign or seal architectural documents. 
If a CE also wanted to become an Architect in the Philippines, the right and lawful things to do are to complete the appropriate academic training in college (i.e. earn a B.S. Architecture degree), undergo a 2-year apprenticeship (minimum of 3,840.0 hours of sub-professional training under a Mentor-Architect) in the planning, design and construction of buildings and to finally take and hurdle the LEA. This is exactly what hundreds of many upright CEs have done from the 1940s through the 1970s.

The DPWH itself, under Sec. 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (not covered by a TRO or injunction since early 2008) has clearly defined what the architectural documents (or the “A” sheets of building plans) are i.e. they are very distinct from civil engineering documents (or the structural or “S” sheets of building plans), defined under Sec. 302.5 of the same IRR. 
Clearly therefore, the term “legally-recognized profession” as mentioned in R.A. No. 9266 and as applied to civil engineering, specifically excludes the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents. 
III. The PRBoA Position on DPWH Executive Issuances that Directly Contravene and Violate R.A. No. 9266 and Its Derivative Regulations  

The PRBoA, mandated under law to primarily implement R.A. No. 9266, is making known herewith its position anent the DPWH Memorandum Circular No. 02 (the “Circular”) dated 16 September 2009 (reference Attachment C), a mere executive issuance signed by then DPWH Secretary Hermogenes E. Ebdane, Jr., which is clearly violative of the law.
[image: image7.jpg]Correct Text of Sec. 304.5.b. of the 2004
Revised IRR of P.D.No.1096/1977 NBCP

Published 01, 08 & 15 April 2005
effective 01 May 2005)

5. Tomms and Cretons of P
T s ki pt sl e sbfct 1 g s an conis:

& That undor Aice 1723 o tha Gk Code f e Phippies, the onginee o
‘chacct wh e up h s s poccaons or LM e & otk
forGrmages i e (1) yoae fom o gl of
0 S Sk colape the (e 1 s o spaciatonsof et
90 o Tho coghos o aichloct W Sipanions o Gaincion b
ol el va e Contacior s 1 G coipss 1 Gl 1
Sonsucten o h uia of e i

Tk smadby B o ey e oy
o e o et e a8y o o S

wmumrj;“:msmrbummu«mum riveness and
Conechnassfhe g corkavco oo ok ani
s ik 1 . e

Dy e —
Epade e, S S5 £ CooTY WA 5 oA
N Bk ok o B 19 e g

Tt et commanoarnent o he propese piacts snd conancion a1
Sl Tlocoton vy s 50 kvl by & by ooraed Ceode

& ottt oo 6 ecnon o
e e g o oo o Cegancy e o, el e o e
e o (10 S b

e ] S et Aot Coteao ot ey b b b

W Tame N e, O 0 e S 4B

T “ T
ity otogt e i B oo b g,
i s s i st e s
Sty and o b e 000 S et o o o b\l o i = G o Oyt
e (e oy oo e
o er e esoet o ko S 5 7 o e ey i

W Tt ol v rion, e et et & o Go e 5 P
ulhmmﬂm»hwmﬂ\ﬂwwnmmwxumn:- 2 RULE V- TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION
e g S v vt o o A

o101 e o e o, 1 Y 2 e o s s SECTION 401 TypoaofConsrction
o

For pugenen of 1o Codo a5 1, ol kg proess
v mam oo e shcraions s e be amited G453 oo b e ollowng e

T o o s connetion. T e o
s pomned by s Cocn

%
;
I
;
%

i ] e i T iy sy ot

P ————— = - T
&"w’u"&“ﬂm’“""' ‘authorities exercising fegualory funcéon affecting fessbre troughoot. Extavor wal shal ba ol incomtatti
& TN S i
Wi S e D R ey e e
LT e
o D A et e QR s R o
h. The OwnerPammiiee shal put a Eulding Pormd sign which comples with the  SECTION 402, Changes in Types.

prescrved Gumonsiont. A ot which SHal T pLdiod on e
e o e G o ootk e rarain posied

P p—




In 2009, the concerned CEs published nationally the said Circular (and to date continues to maintain an electronic copy posted at a website), supposedly directing all building officials nationwide (who are mostly CEs) “to process and issue the necessary permits and certificates to all applicants/ owners notwithstanding whether the designs/ plans and/or other pertinent documents xxx are prepared, signed or sealed by either a registered architect and/or civil engineer” until there is a final and executory decision in the xxx case (i.e. Civil Case No. 05-112502, PICE vs. Ebdane). 

The said civil case merely questioned 2 provisions under the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096, another executive issuance (and not/ never R.A. No. 9266 itself, which remains virtually unchallenged in Court up to this day i.e. NO case has apparently been filed against ANY of the provisions of R.A. No. 9266 or its 2004 IRR or any of the issuances of the PRBoA from 2004 to date).

In mid-2009, a separate permanent injunction addressed to the DPWH, was apparently issued by another Court (RTC) against Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (mentioning the Architectural Permit among 7 basic Ancillary Permits to be secured prior to the Building Permit), as part of a resolution of a separate complaint filed by the Sanitary Engineers (SEs) against then DPWH Sec. Ebdane. 

Please be advised that the Architectural Permit was placed in Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 by the DPWH in mid-2004 purposely to partly comply with the dictates of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) that architectural documents shall be signed and sealed by Architects, as also stated in Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 (reference Attachment I) of the same IRR.

By issuing the questioned Circular (reference Attachment C) and in citing the said 2009 permanent injunction, the DPWH under Sec. Ebdane apparently again hoped it could go around R.A. No. 9266 (which has NO TRO, NO injunction and NO pending constitutional question). The DPWH is apparently using the said permanent injunction (on a portion of a mere executive issuance) to directly contravene and purposely violate the dictates of a valid and subsisting law i.e. R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) itself that LIMITS the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs). 

It also appears that the DPWH is using the same permanent injunction on Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 against the implementation and enforcement of Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 of the same IRR (which has NO TRO and NO injunction since February 2008, when a separate 2005 preliminary injunction was lifted/ dissolved by the Court), and against Sec. 304.5.b of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No.1096, which is in full effect (reference Attachment J).
The supposed permanent injunction on Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 was apparently based on a curable technicality i.e. that the DPWH supposedly failed to publish the necessary Ancillary Permit forms in 2005 in support of the main text of said IRR. What the DPWH should/ could have done in late 2009 was to publish the Architectural Permit form and the 6 other Ancillary Permit forms rather than issue the questioned Circular, which purposely favored the CEs, by allowing the same to continue to practice the separate State-regulated profession of Architecture, in contravention of law. If the DPWH published the said Ancillary Permit forms, it would have effectively fully complied with its own Sec. 304.5.b of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096, which is in full effect, and with all the pertinent professional regulatory laws (PRLs) such as R.A. No. 9266.
[image: image8.jpg]‘seuj| payoley
sjBus uj umoys ‘Aue Ji ‘s/einjonns Bunsixe Bujujolpe Seusiul}
108}Xe pue [Eusjew Jo adAl ‘SyiBw MOpUIM puE J0op !siyl
100} 0} J0O|) 'SUOEAG]® BPEIB USIUY O PUNOIG [ENIRY ‘SEUI|PL

:Buimoys Sue|d J00|j Se B[S BWIES (p) INOJ 1SBE] 1B 'SUONEAGIT A

‘se08dS [RUONIOUN) 4O SWI0O! JO UOEDYNUBP! B181dWI0d
‘SouIpUB :BUIMOUS 00}:} UBU) SS8] 10U JO B[B3S O] UMEIP SUBId J0OI4

“(jona| @ka 1o maiA oho s,pi1q) Juiod
oBRIUBA B WOJ} UBYel PUB 8[E0S JUBILIBAUOD E Je UMEI BAlioedsiad

PoIROIpUI 0q [Iys SBuIpINg Bunsixa pue pesodosd
oy uoamiog seauBISIp pUS poyaley og 1els 1o] o Suuiolpe
PUE UM SBUIPING Buisix3 °seoiases/saniiun oand Bupsixe
pue skenanip pus peos 358300 pasedoid 1o buisix ol oyl o
uoniejol uj eimoniis/buipying pesodoid Jo UoNISod pue UOHEIULIO
's61BPUNOG ‘UoNdYDSEP [BOIULDB) BUIMOYS UBld JuewdojaAeq BN ‘Il

“soualojes ASed Joj sorEyBnoIOy] Jofew JO SyiewpuB)
0US B[EDS UBIUBAUCD AUB Je 'SBUIDIING [2RUAPISe) 10}
SNIPE) JOIOWO|N-{[EY B UM PUE X0IdLIOD [eUONNISUI PUB ‘[eUSNUl
EIIBUILIC? 10} SNIPE) J01WOID 00 © UM Ueld UONEI0 /ARy AUS

sBumeIq/suBId [BIMOBIUOlY "B
SBWNO0T [EANOBIIY '
“SUBINOOP SOUONOB(P |0 BSED

| 490uiBUT SouoNeId Y

tsuewnoop Buiquinid jo eseo Ul yequinid Jeise 6

‘suewnaop AseliuBs Jo 85E0 Ul ‘ieeuibuz Aeiues
IS|UBLUNDOP [BOIUBYIAW JO BSBO Ul JoeuiBuT [BOlUBYOBIY [BUOISSBIO)d '@
1suBLINOOp [B9UI0BIB JO 8SED Ul JBBUIBUT [0MI08[T (U

soj0id P
1SIUBWINGOP [BIMONASAIND JO 8580 Ul 40BUIBUT MDD

1uBls Aew J8UBISEP JOUBIUI 10 OBIYRIE UE JBUYIS ‘SYUBLINoOp UBISep Jousiu
[BINJOBHYOIE JO 3SED U] 'SUBLUINDOP [BINIIBHYOIE JO BSED U 'Ol '

tsue|d Aenins 10| Jo 8SED U 9BUIBUT JNEPOBD ‘B

(2'|ll pue “1'jj| "sBi4) _sjeuoissejoud peseisiBes pue
pesuaol| AINp By} Jo SeWWEU Pelulid ou) JOAO Pajess puE paubls ‘pasedaid
SIUBWNI0P JUIO PUE SUONEOYidads ‘sueid UBISap sueld AeAins Jo Sas (G) oad '€

o[es aInjosqy
J0 pesq o 'eseat jo 1eNUOD U} Jo Adoo pezueiou Ainp Teroge BUl
o1 Uopppe Uj "jo] U 0 Jeumo pesaisibes oyl jou i jueaydde auy oses U “q

1die0ey xe| Auedoid [eel uenng

pue ‘uojeIBieq XeL
I} U0 'LO1/LOO jo Adod eni peynied |
410) 8U} Jo JOUMO PasalsIBa) By st ueolidde ay) Bsed U] B

‘speaq Jo Ansibay aul uim

080 Ul 01 PANILIANS o4 [jeys
oo} 8u} ‘s/uo} uoneaydde pequosesd paUSIdWLIOKE BuY UM JeLyaBOL

“swi0} uoeaydde paquosesd
1 lleys Wwiog Bupiing & Uyim JayeBo) saiued
ue pue jjued Buip|ing B UIBIqo 0} Bulisep uosied Auy ‘|

By uo Jojoau s/u
Kiosse00e/An

s)jwied Joj uopeayiddy  "ZOE NOILOIS




In any event, the lack of the Architectural Permit (by virtue of the standing permanent injunction on Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096) or the non-implementation of the DPWH of  Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 of the same IRR (which has NO TRO and NO injunction since February 2008) does NOT mean that the concerned officials of the Government, particularly those from the Office of the Building Official (OBO) of the LGUs nationwide may contravene and violate a valid and subsisting law such as R.A. No. 9266.  All of the LGU officials concerned, and the private parties that benefited from their actions, may have now all become fully liable for administrative and criminal violations of the law.  

While the above-cited civil case (PICE vs. DPWH Sec. Ebdane, which the CEs incidentally lost and which supposedly involved a question on the signatory to architectural documents) was elevated on appeal to the Court of Appeals in early 2008, the CEs to date have still NOT secured a TRO or injunction against the implementation of Sec. 302.3 & 302.4 (reference Attachment I) of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No.1096, which simply restate the provisions under R.A. No. 9266, in compliance with law.  

The DPWH may have therefore manifestly erred in issuing the subject Circular, as it now constitutes a continuing violation of multiple provisions under R.A. No. 9266, specifically making the LGU officials who continue to uphold the said Circular, administratively/ criminally liable.  In fact, in early November 2009, the PRBoA already filed a Complaint at the Office of the Ombudsman against Government officials and private parties who may have already immensely benefited from their actions. The complaint is still under investigation as of this date.  

IV. Other Laws that Support R.A. No. 9266  

As the DPWH very well knows, the Malacañang Records Office- certified and National Printing Office-certified text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No.1096 (reference Attachments D through G) do NOT state/ NEVER stated that CEs can sign or seal architectural plans/ documents i.e. perspectives, floor/ ceiling/ roof plans, sections; elevations, detailed architectural drawings, schedules of finishes/ doors/ windows, architectural interior (AI) plans and designs, specifications, and the like for ALL buildings on Philippine soil. The said plans/ documents are apparently being referred to under the Circular as “design plans and other pertinent documents”, which have no basis in law since R.A. No. 9266 and its IRR already clearly define such documents as architectural plans/ documents.

The CE law R.A. No. 544 of 1956, as amended by R.A. No. 1582 of 1956 also does NOT state that CEs can prepare, sign or seal architectural plans or documents. In stark contrast, R.A. No. 9266, which repealed R.A. No. 545 of 1950, as amended by R.A. No. 1581 of 1956, expressly LIMITS the preparation, signing or sealing of architectural plans/ documents for ALL buildings on Philippine soil, only to registered and licensed Architects (RLAs). The CE-published DPWH Circular (again, a mere executive issuance that is not a law or state policy)  cannot/ can never supersede, amend nor disregard R.A. No. 9266, a law that has been in full effect since 10 April 2004.
[image: image9.jpg]4146

OFFICIAL GAZETTE Vor, 73, No. 22

to life, bealth, oc safely. This is without prejudice fo fur-
her action that may be taken under the provisions of Arti-
oloa 482 and 694 to 707 of the Civil Code of the Philipnines.

SEC. 216. Other Remedits—The rights, actions and re-
medies provided in this Code shall be 1 addition to any
and sll other vights of action and remadies that may be
available under existing laws.

CraPTER 3
PERMITS AND INSPECTION

S5C. 501, Building Permits.—No persor, firm or corgora-
tion, ineluding auy agency or instrumentality of the gov-
ermment shall erect, anstruct, alter, repsir, move, convert
or demolish any baflding or structure or couse the same
to be dene without firat cbtaining o building permit thero-
for from the Building Official assigned in the place where
the subject building is located or the building work is to
be done.

SEC. 302. Application for permits.—In order to obtain
a building permit, the applicant shull fle an spplication
therefor in writing and e the preseribed form from the
Office of the Building Official. Every application shall
provide at lenst the following nformation:

{1) A description of the work to be covered by the
permit applied for;

(2) Certitied true copy of the TCT cavering the lot un
which the aronosed work is to bz dene. I the applicant
is ot the registered owner, in addition to the TCT, a
copy of the contract of lease shall be submitied.

(3) The use or occupancy for which the proposal work
is intended;

(4) Estimated cost of lhe proposed work.

To be submitied together with such application are ab
least five sets of corresponding plans’ and specifications
prepared, signed and sealed by » duly mechanical engineer
in case of mechanical plaus, and by u. registered electrical
engineer in case of sketrical plans, excopt in fhose cases
exempted or not required by the Building Oficial under
this Code.

Sec. 803 Processing of Building Permits.—The pro-
cessing of building permita chall be under the vverall ad.
‘ministrative control and sepervision of the Building Ofi-
cial and his technical staff of qualified professionals,

Tn processing sn application for & building permit, the
Building Official shall see to it that the applicant satisfies
and conforms with approved standard requirements on
zoning and land use, lines and grades, structural design,
sanitary and sewerage, environmental health, electrical
and mechanical safety ss well as witk other rules and




Since there is NO legal impediment in the implementation of R.A. No. 9266 and its 2004 IRR after it became effective on 10 April 2004 (and 01 December 2004 respectively), the DPWH and the LGUs have NOT acquired any mandate under any law to allow the signing or sealing of architectural plans/ documents for ANY building on Philippine soil by the CEs.

Under R.A. No. 9266, CEs (even if PRC-registered) are classified as unregistered persons who CANNOT undertake the preparation, signing or sealing of ANY architectural plan/ document for ANY building on Philippine soil. The CEs who insist on doing otherwise will thus be held LIABLE for the ILLEGAL practice of Architecture and other violations of R.A. No. 9266.

Unless with the prior official concurrence of the Professional Regulation Commission (PRC) and the Professional Regulatory Boards (PRBs)under R.A. No. 8981 (The PRC Modernization Act of 2000), such as the PRBoA, NO person, not even the DPWH Secretary or the LGU officials such as Building Officials, can unilaterally interpret the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 with respect to State-regulated professional practices and documents, and to potentially/ mistakenly mislead the public into believing that CEs are allowed to sign and seal architectural plans/ documents when the law clearly says otherwise (reference Attachments D, F and G). 

V. The PRBoA Caveat Anent Mandated Compliances Under R.A. No. 9266  

The DPWH, through its LGU Building Officials nationwide are therefore under formal advisement (as they have already been so advised in a 2009 national publication by the PRBoA) to CONTINUE with the implementation and enforcement of Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 (reference Attachment I) of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No.1096 i.e. with a 2008-lifted/ dissolved preliminary injunction (dated May 2005), since the same are fully consistent with at least 4 valid and subsisting national laws i.e. R.A. No. 9266, P.D. No. 1096, R.A. No. 9514 and B.P No. 344.

It is therefore the purpose of this communication to make the LGUs nationwide fully AWARE that until such time that the constitutionality or validity of the said laws are properly challenged at the Supreme Court with respect to the exclusive professional privilege of RLAs over architectural documents, the unabated practice of allowing CEs to sign and seal ANY architectural plan or document must be STOPPED by the Government once and for all. 

The architectural plans/ documents that may have already been signed and sealed by CEs from 10 April 2004 to date are consequently of doubtful veracity and may render the concerned buildings as illegally constructed. 

In the foregoing situation, the building owners who commissioned the CEs, the constructors and developers who used such plans i.e. architectural plans/ documents signed and sealed by CEs, as well as the LGU officers who approved such documents may be held LIABLE civilly, criminally and administratively (or possibly under cases/ complaints of a special nature). In the same vein, LGU officials who approved such documents may first be separately impleaded in administrative and/or special cases that might arise from the flagrant violations of R.A. No. 9266 and of P.D. No. 1096. Legal steps in the future shall include the Court-mandated identification and prosecution of the concerned parties at the LGU who may have conspired to violate R.A. No. 9266 and/or P.D. No. 1096. 

VI. The PRBoA’s Call to Your LGU to Fully Implement and Enforce R.A. No. 9266  

[image: image10.jpg]


In view of the foregoing, the PRBoA in full compliance with law (Sec. 44 of R.A. No. 9266), hereby makes this official call/ request for Your LGU, to fully implement and enforce R.A. No. 9266 (reference Attachment M), with or without the use of Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No.1096.
To help implement R.A. No. 9266 within Your LGU, the following may need to be looked at:

1) The full text of R.A. No. 9266 and its 2004 IRR and derivative regulations such as PRBoA and the pertinent PRC issuances since 2004;

2) The authentic Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 NBCP), which does not mention that CEs can sign or seal architectural documents; and

3) The authentic/ DPWH-published Sec. 304.5.b which is in full effect, there being NO TRO and NO injunction on the same since April 2005 (reference Attachment J) and Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 which are in full effect, there being NO TRO and NO injunction on the same since early 2008 (reference Attachment I) of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 NBCP).

Optionally, Your LGU may consider passing an LGU Executive Order (reference Attachment N) or a Sangguniang Panlungsod/ Pambayan Resolution to fully comply with the mandates and prescribed compliances under R.A. No. 9266.      
Your official response to this communication within the prescribed 15-day period is most desired. A non-response by Your LGU may be taken to mean that R.A. No. 9266 (effective since 10 April 2004) will not be implemented and enforced in Your LGU despite the clear mandate for the LGU officials to enforce said law. The PRBoA will then be free to consider taking the necessary steps to help bring about the mandated compliances through lawful means.  
Thank You very much for considering this very important communication, as it affects all of our collective future. 

Mabuhay ang mga tamang batas na dapat pairalin! 

Mabuhay ang mga mamamayang sumusunod sa batas at ang lahat ng mga kawani ng pamahalaang mga tapat sa kanilang sinumpaang tungkulin sa bayan!!

Mabuhay ang mga Arkitektong Pilipino!!!
Mabuhay po ang Bayan ninyo!!!

Yours sincerely,
For the PRBoA

[image: image11.jpg]SluBWINOOp pelelel JBYID  }
S1UBWND0Q PalRiel I A

SBUNEI PRaIdS-0iljUBPIRION-0I/BAISISEI-01l) LM S[EUoIEW
9A11008p JOBIUI PUE SELIGIBW UOJONIISUOD BISISBI-0ll} 1O SIEIOq

‘sujuado
[B91118A 10} S9INSOJOUB JO UORANNSUOD BANSISEI-8ll} JO SIiEIeq

“SIOPPE| PUB SMOPUIM PRI y

SIXe B11j 'SMOPUIM JO SiIEIOQ

‘210 ‘sufs
‘s1y6) AouaBiow ‘woos suonesado oy ‘wife Bl ‘SIEUIGRO/SINY PIE
152 "SIaUsInBUIXG o1 ‘950U B Yk sadidpusis “Seoln esiodsip
JES O} @InoJ UoNENJEAS 811 BU) Bulealpur Joo)) Yoea jo Ui NoAET |

swownooq Alojes oid o

“8[E0S JUBIUGAUOD AUE 10 0G| JO BJEdS IE [jE SjuaWBIINba)
Kiojes siew pue ‘sease buped Buipnjour Seimonis/sbuiping
PUNoIE pue BpISING SaNIoE) ANlIQISSe298 Yons e Jo UBISSP PaifElad

AR S e T ook seel
o) Al yoeds pue sueld 0

18 4o 8[edS Jo soN 1SS0 B JO SUONEO|

‘SelRWSF 1500 X

‘pesn sjeajew 4o 181

“siieiep Buiysiul pue suiened jem/Buye/100l4

00411 1SES| JB JO 8|eOS |B 8OUBJIUS UIBW BY) WOJj POMBIA SB
an00dsIad JOLIBIUI UM SUOIIJAS MOPUIM SS010 ‘SIGING BOUBIUBALOD.
PUB SI00p ‘SBUINMS 'SBUSIU (BUIMOUS SUONEBABID [|EM JOLIBIU|

‘00131 1520] JE J0 8[eds & Je seouryddenuawdinbe
‘aunyuiny ‘Builsitinj ‘suonied fjem 01BN Jo MNOAE| puB Ueld

“SluBWae JOUBIUI EINIOBIIR Jofew JO UBISEP IBIeG A
‘ol ol pue sjueid Buped 's/ueid ssa00y Al

*sAnoAe| sse00idauBdINbe/BulysIUINyeINYLINS
“s/eoadsiad Jopelu| [BINIOBIYDIY

“s/10uelu] [eIMaBUYIE JO SANOAE] J0 SyUBlY B0RdS

uBise@ Jouejuy/sioualul [RINDBIYAY  ‘q
Siewel3 [einioenyosy Jofew Jaulo jo sieleq X

jona) 100} Jad seoeds
nG [2 10} s pI20g03E pu 9o ‘$0u03 '5100) 10} paljoods
1} 99}ns w10} SiydelS U Buimoys ‘Seysiuld Jo BINPBYDS X

.._$19S 10 JOQUINU PUE 'SEUIBEW 'SUOISUBLUID ‘SYIBW
/suoneuBisep ‘sadAl 118U} BUIMOLS SMOPUIM PUB $100Q JO BINPEUDS

@IN}jUIN} Pax|j PUE SIBJUNOD 'SEUIGED U-INg
Suxe/sadeose oiid
soueixo pue ool SEIS ()
1001 01 pUNOIS Wl SUOo0S AeqEM 129CHL
suosiad paiqesip Joj Bupyed ponseser (
SUBIS [EUODBIIP PUB SIOQUAS SSB0E B|qISSEO0Y
weysks wieje JNBWIONE pue [ensiA OIpNe eqissEodY (1
suio0q ouoydelel aIqnd slqisse0y
SujelNO} BUBULD B]qiSSEo0Y

suopued Jo sadAj |y wn

$]0J}U0D 'SBYIUMS B|qISSBI0Y ()

SWO0J 1I0JWI0D/SERIE [BUONOUN) BIqISSEATY (o)
SABMY[EM PUE SIOPILIOD ‘SBOUENUS O|qISSE00Y (P
sioeABle/Sy BIqiSsEo0Y (o)

SIEIS 8|qISS00Y (0

sduwes ejqisseooy (e

“suONOBS/SUONEABIS 'SUZIC JO WO} AUl Ul





Armando N. Alli

Acting Chairman
att
:
A. 
A Layman’s Evolving Model of the Hierarchy of Laws (State Policies) and Rules and Regulations Affecting the Distinct Practice of the State-regulated Profession of Architecture in the Republic of the Philippines (PH) as of October 2010 (1 page);

B. Matrix Showing the Status of Key Laws(State Policies) and Rules and Regulations Presently Affecting the Distinct Practice of the State-regulated Profession of Architecture in the Republic of the Philippines (PH) as of October 2010 (1 page);

C. The Questioned DPWH Memorandum Circular dated 16 September 2009 that Contravenes the Law (and which is a Mere Executive Issuance that Cannot Supervene a the Valid and Subsisting Provisions of the Law R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) which Expressly Limit the Preparation, Signing and Sealing of Architectural Documents Only to Philippine-Registered and Licensed Architects (RLAs) - (1 page);

D. Certified Copy of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP as signed by President Ferdinand E. Marcos on 27 February 1977 (as certified in 2005 by the Malacañang Records Office) - (1 page);

E. Certified Copy of the signature page of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP as signed by President Ferdinand E. Marcos on 27 February 1977 (as certified in 2005 by the Malacañang Records Office) - (1 page);

F. National Printing Office (NPO) 2009 Certification as to the authentic text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 - (1 page);

G. Malacañang Records Office, Office of the President of the Philippines, 2009 Certification as to the authentic text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 - (1 page);

H. WRONG/ INTERCALATED Published Version of Sec. 302. of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP with POSSIBLY INSERTED Provision Purporting that Civil Engineers can Sign and Seal Architectural Documents - (1 page);

I. [image: image12.jpg]ainbly

SONIMYHA NOILONHLISNOO/SNY1d ONIATING HO4
%2018 31LIL 130N

BN GRS, T

o 50 e 04 e
ot iyt s B 5k b

8 PRV 0 9400 4 e
Svas s o A s AR,

im0 Sy s
[P g st 3w SRR D v

A S B 4 A IS Ol i
) erbey RS 04 RSP0 .

o gt amoda mooswor ey a1 ONHLd

“ON VOaVI

el “ONd

w4 s 520 23 0 W 030
vaconss s ot 1 2080 oo
0 G 3 D 2 W 0 A

SRR L0044 RS D RIS

o 2 e 3 R R 5

Pyl e g
208 e | pimwimsn o ean uch e

fallndl [EET D
] e s sont e 4w
5| msmeat gl ey gy o .

Wi, wwo

P G
S | menver

“kil eanbiy

SONIMYHA NOLLONKISNGD Wﬁﬁmnw@%nﬁﬂzou_
at

eV PUE 2V 'LV 'OV

sszn
]
BTN A
15 0NN
LN

135
e

i u.‘HM/f LI I
=
" / &
R | T
¥ / T
i S H
JE
=k
T
o I
et 13 IH.P 4
1 e G il
el M
T 2 "
ey
SBuriade Jo u
pue SJ00p Sy B
pUE pUNGI Je. "

5002 ‘L 1dy ‘Aepriy




DPWH-Nationally Published Text (01, 08 and 15 April 2005 at the Manila Standard) of Sections 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP (Already Harmonized with R.A. No. 9266 in mid-2004 by the DPWH) Limiting to Architects the Signing and Sealing of Architectural Documents. Since early 2008, there has been NO TRO and NO Injunction Issued by ANY Philippine Court on These Provisions (and which the DPWH Should Have Then Implemented in Compliance with the Law) - (1 page);

J. CORRECT Nationally Published Version of Sec. 304.5.b. of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP Alluding to the Primacy of Professional Regulatory Laws (PRLs) such as R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) - (1 page);

K. WRONG Nationally Published Version of Sec. 304.5.b. of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP with MISSING/ DELETED??? Provision Alluding to the Primacy of Professional Regulatory Laws (PRLs) such as R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) - (1 page);

L. Page 2 of the November 2009 Graft Complaint Filed by the PRBoA at the Office of the Ombudsman Against 3 Senior DPWH Officials, Lawbook Publisher Atty. Vicente Foz and the Philippine Institute of Civil Engineers (PICE) - (1 page); 

M. PRBoA Public Notice - (4 pages); and

N. Sample LGU Executive Order - (1 page).
cc 
:
The Hon. PRC Chairman & Commissioners; The Office of the Ombudsman; and The PRC Regional Offices (by electronic mail) 

file
:
10oct29_PRBoA-471
Attachment A.
A Layman’s Evolving Model of the Hierarchy of Laws 

(State Policies) and Rules and Regulations Affecting the Distinct Practice of the State-regulated Profession of Architecture 

in the Republic of the Philippines (PH) as of October 2010
[image: image13.jpg]The PRBoA is at www.architectureboard.ph

Republic of the Philippines
OFFICE OF THE OMBUDSMAN AN
Agham Road, Quezon City  [TANGGAPAN NG OMBUDS

s
PROFESSIONAL REGULATORY BOARD OF T ¥ 24 &v i

ARCHITECTURE (PRBOA), ; - e
Complainant, PIBISYON NG REKGRIS

- versus - OMB/ADM Case No.
For: Viol. of Secs. 3 par. a), f), i) and

j) of R.A. 3019 and Sec. 4 par. A), b), c),
d), e) and g); Sec. 5 par. a); and Sec. 11
par. a), b) and c) of R.A. 6713

HERMOGENES E. EBDANE, JR.,

Secretary of the Department of

Public Works & Highways (DPWH),

MANUEL M. BONOAN,

Senior Undersecretary of the DPWH,

JAIME A. PACANAN, Ph.D.

Undersecretary of the DPWH

Chairman, DPWH National Building Code

Review Committee (NBCRC) and the

PHILIPPINE INSTITUTE OF CIVIL ENGINEERS

(PICE) and

ATTY. VICENTE FOZ, Publisher of the

Intercalated Version of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 National Building Code of the

Philippines/ NBCP) and its 2004 Revised IRR

Respondents.

AFFIDAVIT-COMPLAINT

I, ARMANDO N. ALLI, of legal age, married, with postal address at
, after being duly sworn to
in accordance with law hereby depose and state as follows:

1. That | am the incumbent Acting Chairman of the PROFESSIONAL
REGULATORY BOARD OF ARCHITECTURE (PRBoA for brevity), a public entity
adjunct to the PROFESSIONAL REGULATION COMMISSION (PRC for brevity) by
virtue of Republic Act (R.A.) No. 8981;

2. The present-day PRBoA was created by virtue of RA. No. 545 as
amended by R.A. No. 1581, and later repealed by R.A. No. 9266, now otherwise
known as the Architecture Act of 2004, the law which governs the State-regulated
practice of the profession of architecture in the Philippines;

3. Section 27, Article Il of the 1987 Philippine Constitution states that “The

State shall maintain honesty and integrity in the public service and take positive
and effective measures against graft and corruption.”;

PRBOA vs. Ebdane, et. al. page 2 of 21



[image: image14.emf][image: image15.jpg]. ' OFFICE OF THE MAYOR

* Municipality of San Fernando Camarines Sur

EXECUTIVE ORDER No____ 02 E
SERIES OF 018

70 ALL CONCERNED:
Whezcas, the Republic Act 9266, otherwise known as the Architecturs Act
of 2004, has been promulgated into law last April 10, 2004 by HE
Presidpnt Gloria Macapagal Arroyo and issuad its Implamenting Rules
and Requlation (IRR) last Dacember D1 2004;

Whereas thece bas bees neither a case nor a patition filed
agminst R.A. No. 9266 or against its 2004 IRR,

Whereas taere has besn neither Tamporary Restraining Order (TRO)
nor injunction, nor pending constitutional question against any of the
proviaions of F.A. No. 9266 ar its 2004 IRR;

Whereas the 2005 preliminary injunction secured by the Civil
Engineers (CEs) against Secs. 302.3 and 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of
P.D. No. 1096, The National Building Code of the Philippines (on the
basis 5f the CEs' wrong citation of the intercalated text of Sec. 302
of P.0. No. 1296/ 1977 WKCP} was clready LIFTED/ DISSOLVED by Lhe
Court in Jamuary 008,

Whereas tr

Iicensed Architacts (RIAs) the professional privilege of signing and
sealing architectural decuments;

5aid soctions ouprossly limit o Ragistered and

Wheress Civil Snginesrs or other prafessions are nét qualifisd
under law to practice architecture, specifically

cigning and sealing of arcaitestursi documents;

sanive officet

Thererore, b

<f this Municipality
¢ s266: The Architecture Act of 2004, BEING A PROMULGATED LAW with its
\’} IMFLOGNTING RULES AND REGUATIONS, shall be in  its  FULL
-\;4, IMPLEMENTATION EFFECTIVE TODAY, FfJ, MARCH 2010.

the power invested in me as the
2f San Parnardo, Camsrines Sur, the Republic Act

roarad »

Tk
EERMIN M. MABULO

-~
.3 o

Lot .
smunicipal mmyor A
Signed thix Day of Mazch, in the year of our zm\

2010 at san Fe: , Camarinas sur, P\ J/xppm%.
e P Tk L ¥ O,











Attachment B.
Matrix Showing the Status of Key Laws 

(State Policies) and Rules and Regulations Presently Affecting the Distinct Practice of the State-regulated Profession of Architecture 

in the Republic of the Philippines (PH) as of October 2010
	A. The LAW and Effectivity Date/ Year
	B. IRR
	C. Important Provisions/ Non-Provisions
	D. Short History/ Comment
	C. Status as of end-Oct 2010

	1. General 

    Laws
	
	
	
	

	a) P.D. No. 1096 (The 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines), 1977
	2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (promulgated by the DPWH in Oct 2004, published thrice in April 2005 & effective 01 May 2005) 
	P.D. No. 1096 Sec. 302 NEVER stated that civil engineers can sign and seal architectural documents; the Sec. 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR clearly LIMIT to Architects the signing and sealing of architectural documents, in full harmonization and compliance with the dictate of law (specifically, with the multiple provisions under R.A. No. 9266)
	On the basis of the intercalated text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096, purporting that civil engineers (CEs) can sign and seal architectural documents, the CEs managed to secure a May 2005 preliminary injunction on Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096; the said 2005 preliminary injunction was already lifted/ dissolved by the Court in early 2008; and 

In mid-2009, a separate permanent injunction was issued by the RTC against the implementation of Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096
which pertain to Ancillary Permit Forms that were NOT published together with the main text of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 in 2005 by the DPWH; this permanent injunction (which also cover Architectural Permit Forms) is NOT about the signing and sealing of architectural documents clearly mandated under the Law R.A. No. 9266, but only of the Architectural Permit Form required by the DPWH; the DPWH is apparently free to publish the 7 Ancillary Permit Forms to cure the legal  technicality that was the basis of the permanent injunction

   
	There is apparently NO TRO and no injunction against Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096

which clearly LIMIT to Architects the signing and sealing of architectural documents; the May 2005 preliminary injunction on the said provisions was already lifted/ dissolved by the Court in early 2008;

and

to date (end-October 2010 or nearly 1.5 years after the permanent injunction on Sec. 301.2.a of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 has been issued), the DPWH has NOT published the seven (7) Ancillary Permit Forms (including the Architectural Permit) to cure the legal technicality that apparently was the basis for the permanent injunction on the said section of the IRR; instead, the DPWH has chosen to allow the CEs to practice Architecture, in clear contravention of the Law R.A. No. 9266, among other laws, making the DPWH and the Building Officials under it, administratively and legally liable, together with all the private parties that benefited from their apparently illegal acts.    

	b) R.A. No. 7160 (The Local Government Code of 1991), c. late 1991
	
	Municipal/ City Engineers (a position under the DILG) are only to assume the post of Building Official (a position under the DPWH) only in an Acting capacity

 
	Since the planning and design of buildings and their environs is an expertise of the Architects (as compared to CEs who are tasked to design the structure that supports the building), the Architects (who are properly qualified by their academic and sub-professional training,licensure examination and continuing professional education) must be appointed to all Government positions requiring dedicated work for buildings 
	Sec. 35 of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004, a later and special law), which mandates that all existing and proposed Government positions requiring the services of Philippine-Registered and Licensed Architects (RLAs) be filled only by such Architects, amends or repeals the pertinent R.A. No. 7160 provisions; Sec. 35 of R.A. No. 9266 has been in full effect since 10 April 2007 (3.5 years).

 

	c) R.A. No. 8981 (The Professional Regulation Commission Modernization Act of 2000), c. 2000
	
	Jurisdiction over 

all State-regulated professions rest solely with the PRC and its Professional Regulatory Boards (PRBs) such as the PRBoA

 
	
	Since October 2009, the DPWH has acquiesced to various official  representations that inter-professional differences be resolved at the PRC, not at the DPWH; the PRC has been tasked to prepare the Profession Harmonization Matrix for Buildings

  

	2. Special 
    Laws
	
	
	
	

	a) R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004, repealing R.A. No. 545 of 1950, amended by R.A. No. 1581 of 1956), 10 April 2004
	2004 IRR of R.A. No. 9266 (promulgated by the PRBoA after the requisite PRC review and approvals c. July 2004, published in the Official Gazette in November 2004 and effective mid-December 2004)
	Multiple provisions under R.A. No. 9266 clearly LIMIT to Philippine-Registered and Licensed Architects (RLAs) the professional privilege of preparing, signing and sealing of ALL architectural documents for ALL buildings on Philippine soil; Sec. 35 of R.A. No. 9266 also mandate that all existing and proposed Govern-ment positions requiring the services of Philippine-Registered and Licensed Architects (RLAs) be filled only by such Architects (effective 10 April 2007)

 
	Since  the passage of R.A. No. 9266 in March 2004 and of the effectivity of its  IRR in late 2004 up to end-Octo-ber 2010, there has apparently been NO legal challenge filed before ANY Philippine Court against ANY of the provisions of R.A. No. 9266 or its IRR or of any known issuance by the PRBoA 
	There is apparently NO TRO, no injunction and no constitutional question before ANY Philippine Court against ANY of the provisions of R.A. No. 9266 or its IRR or of any known issuance by the PRBoA; since 2009, the PRBoA has already sued public and private entities in its drive to fully implement and enforce the law

	b) R.A. No. 544 (The Civil Engineering law of 1950, amended by R.A. No. 1582 of 1956), 1950
	No codified IRR from 1950 up to 2010 (60 years), begging the question as to how it is lawfully implemented by the Government (or is everyone/ every civil engineer just allowed to interpret its provisions based on whim)?
	R.A. No. 544 NEVER stated that civil engineers (CEs) can prepare, sign or seal architectural documents; the law also prescribes the separation of the professional responsibilities and civil liabilities of CEs and Architects
	With R.A. No. 544 (The CE law)’s lack of a codified IRR, the CE are unable to lawfully define the very basic terms “buildings”, “building plans”, “building plans and specifications”; the last concerted attempt to amend/ repeal the CE law (which apparently intended to co-opt or assimilate major parts of the separate profession of Architecture) was defeated by the Architects in Congress in early 2005.

 
	R.A. No. 544 (The CE law) still has NO codified IRR from 1950 up to end-October 2010 (or for more than 60 years)

	c) R.A. No. 9514 (The 2008 Fire Code of the Philippines), 2009
	2009 IRR of R.A. No. 9514 (promulgated in mid-2009 by the DILG Fire Protection Bureau (FPB) and taking effect c. October 2009)
	The law requires that the Fire Safety and Life Assessment Report (FALAR) for buildings shall be the responsibility of Architects and/or their duly-qualified fire/ safety consultants
	Over the period January through June 2010, many Architects have already trained hard for their mandated role in FALAR preparation
	Sometime after assuming office in July 2010, DILG Secretary Jesse Robredo apparently suspended the FALAR requirement, a key safety requirement for buildings.




Attachment C.
The Questioned DPWH Memorandum Circular dated 16 September 2009 that Contravenes the Law (and which is a Mere Executive Issuance that Cannot Supervene a the Valid and Subsisting Provisions of the Law R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) which Expressly Limit the Preparation, Signing and Sealing of Architectural Documents Only to 

Philippine-Registered and Licensed Architects (RLAs)  

Attachment D. 

Certified Copy of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP as signed by President Ferdinand E. Marcos on 27 February 1977 (as certified in 2005 by the Malacañang Records Office)


Attachment F.
National Printing Office (NPO) 2009 Certification as to the authentic text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096


_____________________________________________________________________________________________
Anotation: The National Printing Office is the printer and repository of the printed copies of all laws, rules, regulations, guidelines and manuals of procedure published by the Philippine Government. Please note that contrary to the version of the law being circulated by the Phil. Inst. Of Civil Engrs (PICE) for the last three (3) decades, the original and AUTHENTIC text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) as signed by H.E. Pres. Ferdinand E. Marcos on 19 February 1977 does NOT state that civil engineers (CEs) can sign or seal ARCHITECTURAL documents. Sec.302 of P.D. No. 1096 has NOT been amended nor repealed to date by any other P.D. or executive issuance, other than by the repeal provision of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), approved by H.E. Gloria Macapagal-Arroyo on 17 March 2004, which LIMIT the preparation, signing and sealing of ARCHITECTURAL documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs). 
Attachment G.
Malacañang Records Office, Office of the President of the Philippines, 2009 Certification as to the authentic text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096
[image: image1.jpg]Office of the President

of the Philippines
SMalarafiang

MALACANANG RECORDS OFFICE

CERTIFICATION

TO WHOMTT MAY CONCERN:

This is to certify that according to the records available on file and in the
possession of this Office, Section 302 of Presidential Decree No. 1096 dated February 19,
1977 entitled “Adopting a National Building Code of the Philippines thereby Revising
Republic Act Numbered Sixty-Five Hundred Forty One” has not been amended nor
repealed by any other presidential issuances.

Issued upon the request of Mr. Armando N. Alli, Acting Chairman, Professional
Rz_egulabory Board of Architecture (PRBoA).

MARIANITO M. DI AL

* Director [V, Malacafiang Records Office

Manila, June 4, 2009

Rm 101, Mabini Hall, Malacafiang, Manila  TL — 784-42-86 loc nos. 4911, 4707 & 4031




___________________________________________________________________________________
Anotation: The Malacañang Records Office is the repository of the originals and copies of all laws and regulations promulgated by the Office of the President of the Philippines, specifically all Presidential Decrees (P.D.s, which are laws) issued from 1972 through 1986. Please note that contrary to the version of the law being circulated by the Phil. Inst. Of Civil Engrs (PICE) for the last three (3) decades, the original and AUTHENTIC text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) as signed by H.E. Pres. Ferdinand E. Marcos on 19 February 1977 does NOT state that civil engineers (CEs) can sign or seal ARCHITECTURAL documents. Sec.302 of P.D. No. 1096 has NOT been amended nor repealed to date by any other P.D. or executive issuance, other than by the repeal provision of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), approved by H.E. Gloria Macapagal-Arroyo on 17 March 2004, which LIMIT the preparation, signing and sealing of ARCHITECTURAL documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs). 

Attachment I. 

 DPWH-Nationally Published Text (01, 08 and 15 April 2005 at the Manila Standard) of Sections 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP (Already Harmonized with R.A. No. 9266 in mid-2004 by the DPWH) Limiting to Architects the Signing and Sealing of Architectural Documents.  Since early 2008, there has been NO TRO and NO Injunction Issued by ANY Philippine Court on These Provisions (and which the DPWH Should Have Then Implemented in Compliance with the Law)

Attachment J. 

CORRECT Nationally Published Version of Sec. 304.5.b. 

of P.D. No. 1096/ 1977 NBCP 

Alluding to the Primacy of Professional Regulatory Laws (PRLs) such as R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004)


Attachment L. 

Page 2 of the November 2009 Graft Complaint Filed by the PRBoA at the Office of the Ombudsman Against 3 Senior DPWH Officials, Lawbook Publisher Atty. Vicente Foz and the Philippine Institute of Civil Engineers (PICE) 


Attachment N. 

Sample LGU Executive Order. 


Manual/s of Procedure (MoP)





Guidelines and Standards (based on IRRs)


P.D. No. 1096 Guidelines and DPWH Memoranda Circulars (MCs);


Various PRBoA Resolutions interpreting R.A. No. 9266 & its IRR;


Standard of Professional Practice (SPP) for Architects





Important Note: Guidelines and Standards, as well as Manuals of Procedure (MOPs) may be left to Self-Regulation by the Private Sector








Important Note: After more than 50 years of existence,  R.A. No. 544 (The Civil Engineering law) still does NOT have a codified IRR.








1. Implementing Rules and Regulations/ IRRs (which are only Executive Issuances Used to Implement and Enforce the General Laws, but are NOT by themselves regarded as laws):


2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (promulgated by the DPWH);


IRR of R.A. No. 7160 (promulgated by the DILG);


IRR of R.A. No. 8293 (promulgated by the DTI);


IRR of R.A. No. 9184 (promulgated by the Government Procurement Policy Board/ GPPB led by the DBM);


IRR of R.A. No. 8981 (promulgated by the PRC, now under DoLE);


IRR of R.A. No. 9285 (promulgated by the Supreme Court); and


IRRs of The Various Environmental Laws (promulgated by the DENR).


2. IRRs of Special LAWS


(also mere Executive Issuances that are NOT laws but are 


the actual executive tools to implement and enforce the law):


IRR of R.A. No. 9266 (promulgated by the PRBoA, 


after due approval by the PRC, now under DoLE); 


IRR of R.A. No. 9514 (promulgated by the DILG); and


IRR of B.P. No. 344.





Lower Court Orders and Decisions (that somehow have the Effect of Amending (or Delaying) the Proper (and/ or Timely) Implementation and Enforcement of the Law through the IRRs and lower regulations promulgated by Executive Offices); however, such Lower Court Issuances DO NOT have the power to change the Law itself





Jurisprudence (Supreme Court Issuances such as Final and Executory Decisions and Resolutions that Have the Overall Effect of Changing the Law)





Executive Orders (EOs), Administrative Orders (AOs) and Department Administrative Orders (DAOs) are other forms of Executive Issuances that are also NOT laws but are still tools to facilitate the implementation and enforcement of the law)





1. Considered as General LAWS:


P.D. No. 1096 (The 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines);


R.A. No. 7160 (The Local Government Code of 1991);


R.A. No. 8293 (The Intellectual Property Code of 1997);


R.A. No. 9184 (The Government Procurement Reform Act of 2003);


R.A. No. 8981 (The Professional Regulation Commission Modernization Act of 2000);


R.A. No. 9285 (The Alternative Dispute Resolution Act of 2004);


The New Civil Code;


The Revised Penal Code;


The Water and Sanitation Codes; and


The Various Environmental Laws.


2. Considered as Special LAWS:


R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004, repealing R.A. No. 545 of 1950, amended by R.A. No. 1581 of 1956); 


R.A. No. 544 (The Civil Engineering law of 1950, amended by R.A. No. 1582 of 1956);


R.A. No. 9514 (The 2008 Fire Code of the Philippines); and


B.P. No. 344 (The 1983 Law on Access for the Disabled).











The Fundamental LAW of the Land:


The 1987 Constitution of the


Republic of the Philippines





State-Ratified International Agreements and Treaties (with the effect of Law) e.g. General Agree-ment on Trade in Services (GATS)








