Professional Regulation Commission                                                              The Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (PRBoA)
Manila                                                                                                                                          Office of the Acting PRBoA Chairman
THE OFFICIAL UPDATED PRBoA POSITION ON THE CONTINUING PREPARATION, SIGNING AND SEALING OF ARCHITECTURAL DOCUMENTS BY REGISTERED AND LICENSED CIVIL ENGINEERS (CEs) NATIONWIDE AND RENEWED CALL ON YOUR LGU TO IMPLEMENT/ ENFORCE R.A. NO. 9266 IN ACCORDANCE WITH SEC. 44 OF R.A. NO. 9266 dated 12 September 2009                                           page 36 of 36

[image: image1.jpg]Office of the President

of the Philippines
SMalarafiang

MALACANANG RECORDS OFFICE

CERTIFICATION

TO WHOMTT MAY CONCERN:

This is to certify that according to the records available on file and in the
possession of this Office, Section 302 of Presidential Decree No. 1096 dated February 19,
1977 entitled “Adopting a National Building Code of the Philippines thereby Revising
Republic Act Numbered Sixty-Five Hundred Forty One” has not been amended nor
repealed by any other presidential issuances.

Issued upon the request of Mr. Armando N. Alli, Acting Chairman, Professional
Rz_egulabory Board of Architecture (PRBoA).

MARIANITO M. DI AL

* Director [V, Malacafiang Records Office

Manila, June 4, 2009

Rm 101, Mabini Hall, Malacafiang, Manila  TL — 784-42-86 loc nos. 4911, 4707 & 4031



Republic of the Philippines

Professional Regulation Commission

Manila      
________________________________________________________________________________________________________________

[image: image2.jpg]\‘Rr-_GU LAT/o,
N \Co




The Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (PRBoA)

The Office of the Acting PRBoA Chairman

Email Address: prboa.prc.gov.ph@gmail.com
URL/ website: www.architectureboard.ph
Mobiles:   0922.8415161   0928.3695508   0916.3822826
________________________________________________________________________________________________________________

Your Ref:


        Our Ref : p09sep12_PRBoA-307.1
12 September 2009
(sent by courier LBC on 13 Sep 2009)

Republic of the Philippines

Sangguniang Panlungsod 

City of Cebu

Central Philippines Super Region

ATTENTION
:
HON. MIKE RAMA


Office of the Vice Mayor

First (1st) Floor, Legislative Building, 
City Hall, 6000 Cebu City 

THROUGH
:
HON. NESTOR D. ARCHIVAL, SR.


Office of the Vice Mayor

Third (3rd) Floor, Legislative Building, 
City Hall, 6000 Cebu City 
SUBJECT
:
THE OFFICIAL UPDATED PRBoA POSITION ON THE CONTINUING PREPARATION, SIGNING AND SEALING OF ARCHITECTURAL DOCUMENTS BY REGISTERED AND LICENSED CIVIL ENGINEERS (CEs) NATIONWIDE AND RENEWED CALL ON YOUR LGU TO IMPLEMENT/ ENFORCE R.A. NO. 9266 IN ACCORDANCE WITH SEC. 44 OF R.A. NO. 9266 
Dear Sirs/ Mesdames,


Warm greetings from the Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (the “PRBoA”)!

The PRBoA is transmitting herewith its Position Paper (Part 1 in the 9 pages of this communication and Part 2 in the 19-page attachment to this communication), concerning the continuing practice of civil engineers (“CEs”) in Your LGU, as the same relates to the preparation, signing and dry-sealing of architectural documents i.e. not limited to architectural plans, designs and specifications. Such practices are clear, unequivocal and willful violations of multiple provisions under Republic Act (R.A.) No. 9266, otherwise known as the Architecture Act of 2004, its 2004 Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR) and derivative regulations periodically promulgated by the PRBoA and/or by the Professional Regulation Commission (PRC).
___________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________

Office of the Secretary (AsSec) to the Professional Regulatory Boards (PRBs), 3/F Professional Regulation Commission (PRC) Main Building, PRC Compound, P. Paredes St., cor. N. Reyes St., Sampaloc 1008,  Manila, PH, P.O.Box 2038 Manila  Tel.02.735.1533 (c/o M Taruc)  or c/o 02.314.0018____
PRBoA Telefaxes: c/o 02.454.7592 & c/o 02.286.2678  or  Telephones: c/o 02.441.0856 (Mr. Joey Ponce) or c/o 02.913.6894 (c/o Arch. Dara  Redulla)
Despite the full effectivity of R.A. No. 9266 since 10 April 2004 (almost 5.5 years ago), the CEs continue to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents, specifically architectural plans, with the Accredited Professional Organization (“APO”) for CEs (the PICE), averring that CEs can legally do so by virtue of the following:
1) R.A. No. 544 of 1950 (The Civil Engineering law), as amended by R.A. No. 1582 of 1956, which is the actual CE law that is in effect, having superseded R.A. No. 544 in June 1956);
2) Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines (NBCP) signed by then Pres. Ferdinand Marcos in February 1977 and its revised/ repealed IRRs published before 2005; 
3) Memoranda of the DPWH Secretary/ OIC issued 6 September 2005, 2007 and 2008 allowing CEs to continue to sign and seal architectural plans, ostensibly in compliance with the May 2005 injunction on Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096.      

The PRBoA has the following statements anent the foregoing:

1) Neither R.A. No. 1582 (nor R.A. No. 544) appear to allow CEs to prepare, sign or seal architectural documents, specifically architectural plans; the fact that two (2.0) separate sets of statutes i.e. R.A. Nos. 544 & 1582 (for civil engineers) and R.A. Nos. 545 & 1581 (for Architects) were signed into law in 1950 and subsequently/ consecutively amended in 1956, clearly point to the exclusivity of the practice of the two (2.0) professions; 
· while it may be gleaned from Sec. 2 (a) of R.A. No. 1582 that CEs can design and prepare plans, specifications and estimates for “buildings”, the same is limited by the fact that the word or term “architectural” is never mentioned in R.A. Nos. 1582/ 544 as it constitutes part of a separate practice of the profession of architecture as defined under R.A. No. 1581, a statute passed before R.A. No. 1582; 
· the term “building” as used in Sec. 2 (a) of R.A. No. 1582 does not refer to buildings per se but to buildings forming part of engineering structures or works (please note a comma and not a colon after the word “buildings”; in fact, Sec. 23 of R.A. No. 1582 mentions only “any building or structure intended for public gathering or assembly such as theaters, cinematographs, stadia, churches or structures of like nature” i.e. buildings with large structural spans; 
· a key and most important amendatory provision of R.A. No. 1582 (again, not the superseded R.A. No. 544) is its Sec. 24, which states in part, that “members who are civil engineers shall only render work and services proper for a civil engineer xxx architects shall also render work and services proper for an architect; individual members of such firms xxx shall be responsible for their own respective acts.”; 
· the foregoing sections of R.A. No. 1582 (which is the governing law for CEs since June 1956 i.e. not R.A. No. 544) clearly defines the limits of the CEs’ practice as not extending into the practice of architecture and therefore barring CEs from preparing/ signing/ sealing architectural documents, particularly in light of the more specific and recent approval of R.A. No. 9266 in 2004, a law with much more teeth than either R.A. No. 1581 or R.A. No. 545 (which R.A. No. 9266 collectively repealed); 
· the Department of Justice (DoJ) in its January 2004 Opinion based on the comparison of R.A. No. 1582/ R.A. No. 544 and R.A. No. 1581/ R.A. No. 545 (at the behest of the PICE members of the DPWH Board of Consultants) has already clearly spoken about the definitive distinctions of the 2 professions i.e. architectural plans and designs are for architects and structural plans and designs are for civil engineers (“CEs”); 
· the foregoing should properly address continuing reference/s by the CEs to their supposed “right/s” to prepare, sign and seal architectural plans, a possibly imagined “right” or professional privilege that was never vested upon the CEs since the approval of both R.A. No. 544 and R.A. No. 545 in 1950, nor with the amended R.A. No. 1582 and R.A. No. 1581 of 1956, which clearly separated the respective practices of the two (2.0) professions; 
· CEs who want to enter the practice architecture must attain the following before doing so: 1) secure a B.S. Architecture degree; 2) complete a minimum two (2.0)–year diversified training (apprenticeship) period in the planning/ design/ construction of  buildings; 3) pass the Licensure Examination for Architects (LEA) and 4) be registered/ licensed as an Architect by the PRC (and take the Architect’s Oath and be issued a PRC ID as a Registered and Licensed Architect/ RLA); an additional requirement is the membership certificate from the integrated and accredited professional organization of architects (IAPOA);
· because of the lack of any of the foregoing basic qualifications under law, CEs cannot lawfully practice the separate/ distinct profession of architecture, not now and not ever; 
· the CE registration and license does NOT confer upon CEs any privilege to practice any branch of architecture or to offer and undertake any architectural service specifically defined under Article I Sec. 3 (3) of R.A. No. 9266 (or under the applicable sections of its predecessor laws R.A. No. 1581 and R.A. No. 545); 
· R.A. No. 1582 also does not have a recognizable IRR that should be promulgated by the PRC and that should be used to implement R.A. No. 1582 nationwide; 
· having clearly established that the preparation of architectural documents, specifically architectural plans, do not form part of the practice of CEs, the CEs cannot therefore invoke the applicability of Sec. 43 of R.A. No. 9266, as it clearly does not apply i.e. the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents/ plans do not form part of the practice of the legally recognized profession of civil engineering under R.A. No. 1582 of 1956, which amended R.A. No. 544 of 1950;   
2) There is absolutely nothing in Section 302 of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP, which can be remotely construed as allowing CEs to sign and seal architectural documents, specifically architectural plans; 
· its Sec. 302 (Application for Permits) clearly states “To be submitted together with such application are at least five sets of corresponding plans and specifications prepared, signed and sealed by a duly (sic) mechanical engineer in case of mechanical plans, and by a registered electrical engineer in case of electrical plans, except in those cases exempted by the Building official under this Code.”  
· the version/s of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 and its IRR invoked by the CEs are therefore not consistent with the authentic/ Malacañang Records Office-certified version of P.D. No. 1096 nor with the National Printing Office-certified version printed in the Official Gazette; 
· P.D. No. 1096 and its IRR only cover matters attendant to the planning/ design of buildings/ structures in general and to securing building permits in particular; P.D. No. 1096 and its 2004 Revised IRR, specifically its questioned Sec. 302.3 and 302.4 i.e. in effect from 01 through 24 May 2005 and again from February 2008 to date on the strength of two (2) immediately executory Court Orders, are mere listings of documents to be submitted as part of a building permit application and do NOT govern the practice of the state-regulated professions of architecture and civil engineering; only the professional regulatory laws (PRLs) such as R.A. No. 9266 and R.A. No. 1582 (amending R.A. No. 544) apply to the practice of architecture and civil engineering respectively; 

3) The Memoranda of the DPWH Secretary/ OIC dated 26 September 2005, 2007 and 2008 were ostensibly issued by the DPWH in compliance with the May 2005 injunction on Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096; the said injunction was already LIFTED/ DISSOLVED by the Court in January 2008 and the said LIFTING/ DISSOLUTION was affirmed on 04 May 2009; both Court Orders are lawful and immediately executory by all national and local government officials, in full compliance with the Rules of Court and with Philippine jurisprudence; moreover, the said DPWH Memoranda were mere executive issuances that CANNOT supersede/ take precedence over lawful Court Orders nor over a national law such as R.A. No. 9266 that is in full effect; the same documents also do NOT govern the concerned state-regulated professions; only the professional regulatory laws (PRLs) do.        

Aside from the full effectivity of R.A. No. 9266 since 10 April 2004 and its IRR starting 01 December 2004, the registered and licensed Architects (RLAs) can point to the following laws and regulations attesting to the unequivocal privilege of RLAs to exclusively prepare, sign and seal architectural documents, to wit:

1) R.A. No. 545 of 1950 (the organic architecture law), as amended by R.A. No. 1581 of 1956 (both superseded by R.A. no. 9266 of 2004); these laws were in effect from 1950 through 10 April 2004;
2) the authentic/ Malacañang Records Office-certified true copy of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the National Building Code of the Philippines (“NBCP”) signed by then Pres. Ferdinand Marcos on 19 February 1977, its 1977 IRR published in the Official Gazette and its 2004 Revised IRR, effective 01 May 2005 (of which only Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 were the subject of the May 2005 injunction already lifted/ dissolved as of January 2008 on the strength of a Court Decision cum Order); the said lifting/ dissolution was immediately executory by all national and local government officials under the Rules of Court and Philippine jurisprudence;
3) Court’s 04 May 2009 Affirmation Order of its January 2008 Court Decision cum Order that lifted/ dissolved the May 2005 injunction on Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096); similarly, the said May 2009 Order is immediately executory by all national and local government officials under the Rules of Court and Philippine jurisprudence; 

4) the January 2004 Department of Justice (DoJ) Opinion promulgated after comparing R.A. Nos. 544 & 1582 (CE laws) with R.A. Nos. 545 & 1581 (predecessor laws of R.A. No. 9266); the DoJ opinion was undertaken at the instance of the PICE members under the DPWH Board of Consultants (BoC), the DPWH advisory body mainly responsible for crafting the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (part of which became subject of the May 2005 injunction issued at the PICE’s and CEs’ behest, already lifted/ dissolved by the Court as of January 2008).  

The PRBoA has the following statements in full support of the foregoing:

1) Sections 3 (3), 20, 25, 29, 30, 31, 32 and 34 of R.A. No. 9266 are explicit in their limitation of the professional privilege to prepare, sign and seal architectural plans only to registered/ licensed architects (RLAs); 
· The foregoing are but echoes of the specific provisions of R.A. No. 545 of 1950, R.A. No. 1581 of 1956 and even of Sec. 24 of R.A. No. 1582 (amended CE law of 1956); 
· while Sec. 43 of R.A. No. 9266 states “This Act shall not be construed to affect or prevent the practice of any other legally recognized profession“, the plain language of the law must be viewed in light of what are actually allowed under the other professions i.e. despite the CEs protestations to the contrary, their R.A. No. 1582, which amended R.A. No. 544 do not vest on the CEs the professional privilege to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents; the approval and effectivity of R.A. No. 9266 and its derivative regulations are all testimony to the exclusivity of the Architect/ RLA’s practice insofar as the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents are concerned; 

· whatever the CEs were used to doing before R.A. No. 9266 took effect on 10 April 2004 cannot and must not be allowed to continue while R.A. No. 9266 is valid and subsisting;
· Sec. 46 of R.A. No. 9266 also specifically states that “all other laws, orders (specifically including preliminary injunctions that may be wrongfully founded or based on the potentially material misrepresentations by the CEs), rules and regulations or resolutions (specifically those that may have been issued by the Board of Civil Engineering to possibly contravene R.A. No. 9266, its IRR or its derivative regulations) or parts thereof inconsistent with the provisions of this Act are hereby repealed or modified accordingly.”; emphases and annotations by the PRBoA 
2) Although the authentic/ certified version of P.D. No. 1096 of February 1977, particularly its Sec. 302, also does not specifically mention architects as a signatory to architectural documents, the fact that R.A. Nos. 545 & 1581 (and CE practice limitations under R.A. Nos. 544 & 1582, specifically Sec. 24) all exist and were all in full effect at the time of the signing of P.D. No. 1096, are more than sufficient arguments to limit the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents only to registered/ licensed architects (RLAs); 
· Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the 1977 NBCP (reference Attachment 1), which were the subject of the May 2005 injunction secured by the CEs, but subsequently lifted/ dissolved in January 2008, were merely listings of documents to accompany a building permit application i.e. not a state prescription for professional practice; and

3) The DoJ has clearly spoken on the matter of the exclusivity of the two (2.0) practices based on a comparison of their decades-old laws i.e. the practice of architecture is only for architects and not for other state-regulated professionals, particularly civil engineers; future DoJ legal opinions would again most likely uphold the architects’ exclusive practice in light of a more robust, more stringent and highly restrictive architecture law (in R.A. No. 9266). 

Considering the foregoing and in accordance with Sec. 44 of R.A. No. 9266, the PRBoA respectfully requests/ calls on the Your LGU to:

1) uphold R.A. No. 9266 and its IRR on the matter of the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents inasmuch as R.A. No. 9266, its IRR and its derivative regulations are not covered by any temporary restraining order (“TRO”) nor by any injunction nor by any pending question as to the constitutionality of any of its provisions;

2) assist the PRBoA in upholding the PRBoA Memo 2005-08 dated 05 July 2005 (reference Attachment 2), promulgated in accordance with R.A. No. 9266 in its entirety, particularly since the PICE, the APO of CEs, was amply represented during the meetings and public hearings on the crafting of R.A. No. 9266 from 2002 through 2004;

3) based on existing laws, officially bar CEs from preparing, signing and dry-sealing architectural documents due to the following reasons:

a. limitations explicitly stated under their law R.A. No. 1582 of 1956 (which amended R.A. No. 544 of 1950), both of which never stated that CEs can prepare, sign nor seal architectural documents;

b. the CEs’ total lack of academic training, sub-professional (diversified training) preparation and professional education/ development for architectural plan and design preparation;

c. the fact that CEs were/ are never tested by the state i.e. by the PRC itself, for their architectural plan and design capabilities; 
d. the CEs’ lack of an architect’s registration and license as mandated by R.A. No. 9266 (and by the predecessor laws on architecture, R.A. No. 545, as amended by R.A. No. 1581); 
e. the CEs non-membership in the IAPOA and their lack of an IAPOA certificate, which is an additional requisite to the signing and sealing of architectural documents; and

f. the CEs’ lack of continuing professional development (CPD) training in architectural plan/ design matters;

4) declare that the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents by registered/ licensed CEs is contrary to law, particularly with respect to R.A. No. 9266 and with respect to the authentic/ Malacañang Records Office-certified (reference Attachment 3) and the National Printing Office-certified (reference Attachment 4) true copies of P.D. No. 1096 itself and of its Official Gazette-published version respectively; 
5) declare that CEs preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents are in direct violation of the multiple provisions of R.A. No. 9266 that limit to RLAs the professional privilege of preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents as defined under R.A. No. 9266, its IRR and derivative regulations; and
6) approve en toto the City Ordinance being introduced/ sponsored by the Honorable Councilor Nestor D. Archival, which intends to comply with the dictates of law, specifically of R.A. No. 9266.


The CE’s unilateral, liberal and misleading interpretation of their law R.A. No. 1582, which amended R.A. No. 544, have caused extensive, prolonged and undue harm to the architectural profession. Due in part to the extreme patience, altruism and professionalism exhibited by Philippine Architects/ RLAs, the CEs have continued to sign and dry-seal architectural documents for nearly 5.5 years, contrary to law and despite the very existence and effectivity of R.A. No. 9266, its IRR and derivative regulations.    


The PRBoA trusts that Your LGU shall find this communication and its accompanying documents in order. Your support for Councilor Archival’s Ordinance shall enable the PRBoA and the RLAs to officially campaign for greater implementation of R.A. No. 9266 in Cebu City and elsewhere in the Central Philippines Super Region. 

It is very important to note again that the acknowledged father of both R.A. No. 7160, otherwise known as the Local Government Code and of R.A. No. 9266, The Architecture Act of 2004, the good Senator Aquilino Q. Pimentel, Jr., has on many occasions confirmed the primacy and sole vested privilege of registered/ licensed architects (RLAs) insofar as the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents are concerned. 


Summing up, the PRBoA would like to further state that we are a government of laws, not of men nor of biased and wrongfully-founded/ issued court injunctions (based on the potentially deliberate misrepresentations by the CEs), which do not even remotely apply to R.A. No. 9266, a valid and subsisting law which has no TRO, no injunction and no pending constitutional question. An unrestrained national law such as R.A. No. 9266 has to be accorded its due respect and be made to prevail over erroneous and/ or unfounded and self-serving interpretations by CEs of inferior/ incorrectly invoked regulations/ laws or of superseded and antiquated laws. 

Under Philippine law, the registered/ licensed architects (RLAs) are the only state-regulated professionals vested with the sole and exclusive privilege to prepare, sign and seal architectural plans, designs, specifications and documents; as such, other state-regulated professionals such as the CEs must recognize this fact sooner or later. The supposed “overlaps” in professional practice pertaining to building plan/ design preparation only exist in the conditioned minds of the supposed CE leaders.

The PRBoA must insist that the implementation of the law (R.A. No. 9266) should no longer be delayed, as it has already been in effect since 10 April 2004. For the last fifty nine (59) years, our fellow state-regulated professionals, the CEs have continued to reap benefits and exercise professional privileges that were never theirs by right nor as prescribed under any law. R.A. No. 9266 only reiterated what was already stated under R.A. No. 1581 of 1956 and R.A. No. 545 of 1950 i.e. that the practice of architecture is vested only on registered/ licensed architects (RLAs) and on no one else. It is now time for the rightful state-regulated professionals to do the job and to render services to a public that has long been deprived and confused by the CEs’ selfish insistence that they are “capable” of doing the Architect’s work. If CEs want to practice architecture, they must become Architects first. The law may be harsh but it is the law.


The PRBoA looks forward to Your LGU’s kind attention and prompt/ resolute action of this very, very urgent matter which cries to the heavens for an early, definitive and decisive resolution. Your LGU’s understanding and assistance will go a very long way in helping relieve the continuing/ decades-long injustice foisted on Philippine Architects/ RLAs, presently exacerbated by the flagrant and willful violations of R.A. No. 9266 for the nearly 5.5 years that it has been in full effect.

Thank You all very much.

Mabuhay ang mga tamang batas na dapat pairalin! Mabuhay ang mga Arkitektong Pilipino!! Mabuhay ang LGU ng Cebu City!!!

Yours sincerely,

For and with the full authority 

of the PRBoA
Original Signed

Armando N. ALLÍ

Chairman
file: p09sep11_PRBoA-307.1
att : a/s (plus Part 2 of the Position Paper, 19 pages)
Attachment 1. 

Authentic Text of Secs. 302.3 and 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. 1096 (1977 NBCP) as promulgated in 2004 and as published in April 2005 by the DPWH (originally effective from 01-24 May 2005 and already declared IN FULL EFFECT by the Court/ RTC Manila Branch 22 in its Order (forming part of a Decision) dated 
29 January 2008 and in its Affirmation Order dated 04 May 2009) – (2 pages)
[image: image3.jpg]FERNITS IND TMSPECTION

SFCPTON 301. Buliding Permits

Mo persei; firm ar corpocation, imciuding mey syescy
or instrumentslity of the gavernment shall erect, conmtruct,
slter, repuir, Wove, oouvert or demgish any bufldiag or
siructitve er cauie the same Lo bu dome vithout firat obtain-
Ing & building permit therefor frou the Bullding Official
#3higaed in the place wnere the subject building is iocaten
or the building work is to bs dowe. -

SECTION 302. ipplication for permits -

In' arder €6 obtaid & buflding pearmit, the app)icant
SHAIL file s application therafor in witing and on- th
Prascribed form from the OFfive af 1he Butlnssg Orfictal.

Bvery applicstios shsll provide st Tesst the Zoliowing
information:

, (1) X description of the vark tu he covered by bthe
pormit applicd far;

(3) Cartified true copy of the TCT covering the lot
on which ibe propused work is to be deme. If the applicant
% not the régiztersd dwnsr, in-addition te the 1CT; a copy,
of the soniract of leass akal) be wubmitteds

€3) The use or sesupancy for whick the propossl work
1s intendeq;

(Y Estimatad cast of the proposed work.

To e submitted togother with ssch application are at
least five sets of corréapemding plans and specificati P4l
Braparaé,”signed and sedled by a duly msckenical engincer
in ctase of mechanical jlana, end iy & Fepirtered electrical
empinger in Gise of $lctriml plans, excert in those cmues
azenptod or net required by tha Buildimy Official under this
Code.





_____________________________________________________________________________________________

Annotation: Please note that the Court’s 04 May 2009 Affirmation Order covering its 29 January 2008 Order LIFTING/ DISSOLVING its May 2005 injunction are all immediately executory under the Rules of Court and by jurisprudence i.e. Rule 39 Sec. 4,  Crisostomo vs. SEC, 179 SCRA 146, Santiago vs. Vasquez, 217 SCRA 633, Marcelo Steel Corp vs. 54 SCRA 89, Golez vs. Leonidas, 107 SCRA 187. Since Sections 302.3 and 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/NBCP) have already been in effect from 01 through 24 May 2005, the DPWH is therefore mandated to CONTINUE with the interrupted implementation/ enforcement of the said sections, to fully comply with the 2009 and 2008 Court Orders. It has been more than eighteen (18) months since the Court promulgated its 2008 LIFTING/ DISSOLUTION Order. To date i.e. early September 2009, the DPWH apparently continues to resist not only the Court Order but also fail to implement/ enforce valid and subsisting laws such as R.A No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) and even P.D. No. 1096 itself, the very law the DPWH is supposed to fully implement/ enforce. 

[image: image4.jpg]



_____________________________________________________________________________________

Annotation: Please note that the Court’s 04 May 2009 Affirmation Order covering its 29 January 2008 Order LIFTING/ DISSOLVING its May 2005 injunction are all immediately executory under the Rules of Court and by jurisprudence i.e. Rule 39 Sec. 4,  Crisostomo vs. SEC, 179 SCRA 146, Santiago vs. Vasquez, 217 SCRA 633, Marcelo Steel Corp vs. 54 SCRA 89, Golez vs. Leonidas, 107 SCRA 187. Since Sections 302.3 and 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/NBCP) have already been in effect from 01 through 24 May 2005, the DPWH is therefore mandated to CONTINUE with the interrupted implementation/ enforcement of the said sections, to fully comply with the 2009 and 2008 Court Orders. It has been more than eighteen (18) months since the Court promulgated its 2008 LIFTING/ DISSOLUTION Order. To date i.e. early September 2009, the DPWH apparently continues to resist not only the Court Order but also fail to implement/ enforce valid and subsisting laws such as R.A No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) and even P.D. No. 1096 itself, the very law the DPWH is supposed to fully implement/ enforce. 

Attachment 2. 

PRBoA Memorandum Circular No. 2005-08, issued by the Professional Regulation Commission (PRC) to the DILG and the DPWH, among other key NGAs, in relation to the implementation and enforcement of R.A. No. 9266 

[image: image5.jpg]I k ’ REET
> - . 14
SECHTON 2105. Effectivity -

-~

Thin Decree shall lake affect upen its promulgation.

& in the City of Manila, this _/Q& day -

of in the year of gur Lord, nineteen e
bundred Zad ghventy seven. - .
2, s

S

- Rc[#uﬁl»i





[image: image6.jpg]4146

OFFICIAL GAZETTE Vor, 73, No. 22

to life, bealth, oc safely. This is without prejudice fo fur-
her action that may be taken under the provisions of Arti-
oloa 482 and 694 to 707 of the Civil Code of the Philipnines.

SEC. 216. Other Remedits—The rights, actions and re-
medies provided in this Code shall be 1 addition to any
and sll other vights of action and remadies that may be
available under existing laws.

CraPTER 3
PERMITS AND INSPECTION

S5C. 501, Building Permits.—No persor, firm or corgora-
tion, ineluding auy agency or instrumentality of the gov-
ermment shall erect, anstruct, alter, repsir, move, convert
or demolish any baflding or structure or couse the same
to be dene without firat cbtaining o building permit thero-
for from the Building Official assigned in the place where
the subject building is located or the building work is to
be done.

SEC. 302. Application for permits.—In order to obtain
a building permit, the applicant shull fle an spplication
therefor in writing and e the preseribed form from the
Office of the Building Official. Every application shall
provide at lenst the following nformation:

{1) A description of the work to be covered by the
permit applied for;

(2) Certitied true copy of the TCT cavering the lot un
which the aronosed work is to bz dene. I the applicant
is ot the registered owner, in addition to the TCT, a
copy of the contract of lease shall be submitied.

(3) The use or occupancy for which the proposal work
is intended;

(4) Estimated cost of lhe proposed work.

To be submitied together with such application are ab
least five sets of corresponding plans’ and specifications
prepared, signed and sealed by » duly mechanical engineer
in case of mechanical plaus, and by u. registered electrical
engineer in case of sketrical plans, excopt in fhose cases
exempted or not required by the Building Oficial under
this Code.

Sec. 803 Processing of Building Permits.—The pro-
cessing of building permita chall be under the vverall ad.
‘ministrative control and sepervision of the Building Ofi-
cial and his technical staff of qualified professionals,

Tn processing sn application for & building permit, the
Building Official shall see to it that the applicant satisfies
and conforms with approved standard requirements on
zoning and land use, lines and grades, structural design,
sanitary and sewerage, environmental health, electrical
and mechanical safety ss well as witk other rules and





Attachment 3.1 

Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. 1096 as signed by H.E. Ferdinand E. Marcos 

on 19 February 1977 (2 pages)
[image: image7.jpg]SECTION 302.  Application for Petmits .~ |

1. Any parson desidng to obtain a bisking!permit and.any ancillary/accesso
pormie logether wth a Bulding Permit shall Tl .pm&w. heretor on hg
prem!bed upplluﬂo forms.

2 mﬂh-r with the accomplished prescribed applicafion formys, the foliowing

be submitted 1o the OBO:

a |nr.mmawplum|nmmmedmuofmem
L Cortiid trus copy of OGT/TCT, o file with the Registry of Deeds,
il Tax Deglaration, and ;

Current Resl Property Tex Receipt

b ineusme?pik:anllsm( the ot owner of o ot in addion

the above; duly notarized -copy of the Contract of Lease, or Deed of
Honchoie Gl

3. Fiva (5)sete of survey plan, dosign plans, spocifications and ather documents
mrmd signed Il!d sealed over ‘Dﬁntad namas of the duly licensed
eteret profossionais  (Figs. L1 and IS
Geodetic Engineer, in case of lat survey plans;

Architect, in case of architsctural documents; in casa of architectural Interlor/
intarior design documents, either an arohitact or interior designer may sign;

Civil Engineer, in case of civil'structural documents;

Professional Electrical Enginger, in case of electrical documents;

Professional Mechanical Enginesr, in case of mechanical documents;

Sanitary Engineer, In case of sanitary documents;

Master Plumber, in case of plumbing documents;
h. Electronics Engineer, in case of electronics documents.

4.7 Architectural Documents
a. Architectursl Plans/Drawings

L Vicinky M Wmmmlnizﬂﬂhmmhmm
industra), and Instiutional complex and within a halfklomater radlus
for residéntial buiid at any-cohvenient scale showing W'Irlﬂﬁ
landmarks or major thoroughfares for. easy reference.

i Site Dovelopment Pien ehewing fochrica description, boundaries,
o Illﬂﬂ of W Abuilding/structure in Mlhoﬂ
lo the lot, ﬁilﬂ orF pmpond dccess road and driveways and
existing public sBpvices. . Existing buildings within and
.ujolun lhe ot shalt be-halched and distances beiween the
and existing buikings shall be indicated.

Hil. Parspective drawn at a conveniant scale and taken from nvnmam
point (bird's eye view o ys level).

tv. Fmelmsmnlomhmmlmmmnousmm riiri
wnnlﬂhidﬂnﬂlclondmomlm'uncﬁmiﬂ B =

v.  Elsvations, at least four (43, ‘o same scale as fioor pians showing:
ridiines; fatural Joien grado slevatlons floor o oot
[gmu, "door a um‘u ps of material and exterior
{nishgs: adjcining, mnnq iefs, if any, shown in single

~ e e ¥

@





__________________________________________________________________________

Annotation: Please note that contrary to the intercalated (wrongly worded) version of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 apparently being circulated by the Phil. Inst. of Civil Engrs (PICE) and its affiliated organizations, quite possibly over the last three (3) decades, the original and AUTHENTIC text of Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) as signed by H.E. Pres. Ferdinand E. Marcos on 19 February 1977 does NOT state that civil engineers (CEs) can sign or seal ARCHITECTURAL plans. Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 has NOT been amended nor repealed to date by any other P.D. or executive issuance, as confirmed by separate June 2009 certifications issued by the National Printing Office (publisher of the Official Gazette) and by the Malacañang Records Office (the repository of all documents promulgated by the Office of the President), such as P.D. No. 1096. Only the repeal provision of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), approved by H.E. Gloria Macapagal-Arroyo on 17 March 2004, which LIMIT the preparation, signing and sealing of ARCHITECTURAL documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs) has effectively repealed Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096. 

[image: image8.jpg]o o Powtile, 16 the' Torm of plans, elevations/oections:

b

" EH Yinps .
Ar.castlble stairs
Accessiblo lfta/alovators
Accessible entrances, comidors and walkways
‘Accessibie functional areas/comfort rooms
Accessible swiches, cortrls

ible ﬂ(mh

ublic ?elspmm booths

A aails DUk k) ond amometio alarm systom

Accessible accoss symbols and rotiones Sghe

Bessrved paridng for disablod persons

e wllsay Sorot o owed B roof

Stairs, fnerior and exterior

BuHHn ubinm cullm and fixed furniture

of pertlitions

Ix. Sﬂh‘dull Bm-mwmmn:hmmmsl , designations/
Tares, Qimanaions, Matetiais, and number of e oo

« Schidup b mm;m shoving in greohic form suface, nishes
specifed forfors, calings, wa ‘baseboard trims for n
xi. Details of other mejor Architecturst Elements.
b. " Architectural interiore/interior Design
i Space Plarvs or layouts of architectural interior/s.
Il Architectural interior perspectivels,
iit. * FumMurefumishing/equipment/process layoutis.
iv. Accsss planss, parking plan/s and the ke,
v, Detall-design of major architectursl interior elsments.

vi. Plan.and ut of Interior, wall partitions, furnishing, fumiture,
m%mnwﬂeduﬂem”wm

Vi, Interior wall elet
conveniel

ions shawing: finishes, switches, doors and
e outiats, cross window s With pers
a8 viewed from the main entrance at scale of at feast 1:100.

Floor/ceiling/wall pattems and finishing. details.
i List of materlals used.
x. Cost Estimates.
o Plans and specifc locations of ai mcuummy tacifios of soale of at

Detailod ddsign of all such aecmammy faciltos outskle and around
bulldlngslstmclurel including pariing areas, and theis safety
requirements all at any convanient scale.

e. Fira Safety Documents.

i La lan of each floor indicating the fire evacuation route io safe
e s

real sreas, e hose, fire axtinguishers, fst
..5” m "”2&‘;'3““ rations room; ome%mcydgm
signs,

Detzils of windows, fire exits with griied windows and ladders.

@, Details of fire-resisiive construction of enclosures for vertical
openings.

iv. Details of fire-resistive.construction materials and interior decorative
materials with nre—mumﬁvelﬁr‘-rmudamlme-lwead ratings

v. Other Related Documants
1. Other related documents




__________________________________________________________________________

Annotation: Please note that contrary to the intercalated (wrongly worded) version of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 apparently being circulated by the Phil. Inst. of Civil Engrs (PICE) and its affiliated organizations, quite possibly over the last three (3) decades, the original and AUTHENTIC text of Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) as signed by H.E. Pres. Ferdinand E. Marcos on 19 February 1977 does NOT state that civil engineers (CEs) can sign or seal ARCHITECTURAL plans. Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 has NOT been amended nor repealed to date by any other P.D. or executive issuance, as confirmed by separate June 2009 certifications issued by the National Printing Office (publisher of the Official Gazette) and by the Malacañang Records Office (the repository of all documents promulgated by the Office of the President), such as P.D. No. 1096. Only the repeal provision of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), approved by H.E. Gloria Macapagal-Arroyo on 17 March 2004, which LIMIT the preparation, signing and sealing of ARCHITECTURAL documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs) has effectively repealed Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096.
Attachment 3.2 

Certification that Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. 1096 has Not been Amended since its promulgation in February 1977 (as certified for the Court by 

the Malacañang Records Office on 05 June 2009)
[image: image10.jpg]Bl

ke Sty f P, i iy desid i, sl o ol
e e s oy e s
e o e s

e s o N OO i S A
e RC sl o conened g o SHOrE
B vttt s of e st 2 O

St o s sy e,

MUGENE G.GAN
ool A

oy [

1EONORTRIFONROSERO
Chiperan.

Pt Regobion Comisin




___________________________________________________________________________________

Annotation: The Malacañang Records Office is the repository of the originals and copies of all laws and regulations promulgated by the Office of the President of the Philippines, specifically all Presidential Decrees (P.D.s, which are laws) issued from 1972 through 1986. Please note that contrary to the intercalated (wrongly worded) version of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 apparently being circulated by the Phil. Inst. Of Civil Engrs (PICE) and its affiliated organizations, quite possibly over the last three (3) decades, the original and AUTHENTIC text of Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) as signed by H.E. Pres. Ferdinand E. Marcos on 19 February 1977 does NOT state that civil engineers (CEs) can sign or seal ARCHITECTURAL plans. Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 has NOT been amended nor repealed to date by any other P.D. or executive issuance, other than by the repeal provision of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), approved by H.E. Gloria Macapagal-Arroyo on 17 March 2004, which LIMIT the preparation, signing and sealing of ARCHITECTURAL documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs). 

Attachment 4. 

Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. 1096 as published in the Official Gazette 

(and as certified for the Court by the National Printing Office on 04 June 2009)

[image: image9.jpg]e Seputtic of e Dlppines
p oo Peatessional Beglation Comn
Riice Aanita

. JOARD OF ARCHITECTURS

MEMORANBUN CIRCULAR NO. 2005-00
Seres of 2005

o ESE DEPARTMENTS: JUSTICE, _FORHIGN
AEFAIRS, NEALTH, INTERIOR AND LOCAL
GOVERNMENT, | PUBLIC  WORKS _AND
TIGAWAYS, DUDGET AND MANAGEMENT,
ADE  AND  INDUSTRY, LABOR  AND
EMPLOYMENT, TUESE COMMISSIONS: CIVI
SERVICE, SECURITY AND EXCHANGE: THESE
SOARDS PHLIPIN CONTRACTOKS
ACCREDITATION,  PHILIPING  DOMESTIC
LONSTRUCTION. CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRY.
SRBITHATION, = NATIONAL BUREAU O
IAVESTIGATION, PHILIPPINE RATIONAL POLICE.

SUBECT  ENFORCEMENT OF THE PROVISIONS OF ILA,NO.
i, T ARGHITECTURE ACT OF 2001"
BOARD RESOLUTION NO. 07, SERIES OF 201
Ak “IR OF THE ARCHITECTURE ACT OF 2004
A NO, 8031, THE "PRC MODERNIZATION ACT
G 2000 PRC RESOLUTION NO. 01, SERIES OF
2001, 1 18R OF KA, NO. 975

T e Sesion Commision PRC) s e B of Az
(50 i e o b v T A No. 26, B R o
S Y o, PRC T o. 01, S o 301 ok

e e oo o, s oo, o 7
e o e il el pman oS 5, .V





_____________________________________________________________________________________

Annotation: The National Printing Office is the printer and repository of the printed copies of all laws, rules, regulations, guidelines and manuals of procedure published by the Philippine Government. Please note that contrary to the intercalated (wrongly worded) version of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 apparently being circulated by the Phil. Inst. Of Civil Engrs (PICE) and its affiliated organizations, quite possibly over the last three (3) decades, the original and AUTHENTIC text of Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) as signed by H.E. Pres. Ferdinand E. Marcos on 19 February 1977 does NOT state that civil engineers (CEs) can sign or seal ARCHITECTURAL documents. Sec. 302, Chapter 3 of P.D. No. 1096 has NOT been amended nor repealed to date by any other P.D. or executive issuance, other than by the repeal provision of R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), approved by H.E. Gloria Macapagal-Arroyo on 17 March 2004, which LIMIT the preparation, signing and sealing of ARCHITECTURAL documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs). 
POSITION PAPER (PART 2) OF THE PROFESSIONAL REGULATORY BOARD OF ARCHITECTURE (PRBOA) AS TO THE MATTER OF WHICH STATE-REGULATED PROFESSIONAL MUST PREPARE, SIGN AND SEAL ARCHITECTURAL DOCUMENTS 
Updated 11 September 2009

_________________________________________________________________________________________

A dispute that has raged for about six (6) decades continues to this very day. To put it simply, should Philippine Civil Engineers (the “CEs”) be allowed to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents?  

1.
What are architectural documents?

Generally speaking, the term architectural documents refer to architectural plans, designs, specifications and related documents normally prepared by Architects registered and licensed under Philippine law. Architectural documents form the most important part of any set of building plans which ordinarily include several classes of “derivative” plans/ designs. 

By “derivative” plans/ designs, what is meant is that all the other types of “building” plans/ designs, particularly all the classes of engineering plans/ layouts/ designs, and of allied architectural plans/ layouts/ designs, can commence only after the architectural plans and designs have been sufficiently evolved and refined.  The architectural plans/ designs largely determine the content of all the subsequent or derivative plans/ layouts/ designs required to produce a complete set of “building” plans/ designs and documents.

The following are universally recognized as standard architectural documents or deliverables/ outputs prepared, signed and sealed only by registered and licensed Architects (the “RLAs”) in the Philippine setting:

1) exterior perspective (a drawing showing the exterior of a completed building/ structure);

2) site development plan or SDP (showing the relationships between a Project Site and the footprint and roof-print of a building or a structure and which may already include locations for both hard and soft landscape architectural elements and civil works elements like perimeter walls, road rights-of-way/ RROWs, driveways and parking spaces);

3) floor plans (drawings showing the physical arrangement and relationships of of the spaces to be built and forming part of the building or structure);

4) sections (longitudinal and cross; drawings showing the interior of the building or structure including the roof cavity if present);

5) elevations (drawings showing the front, right side, rear and left side views of the building or structure once completed);

6) reflected ceiling plans (drawings showing the arrangement of ceiling finishing elements); a separate roof cavity floor plan could also be specified for complicated ceiling structures that require access systems;

7) roof plans (drawings showing the type of roof solution specified, including provisions for drainage);

8) schedules of doors and windows (drawings showing the detailed designs and finishing of all specified doors and windows or other forms of fenestrations);

9) schedules of finishes, fixtures and hardware (tables showing all finishing items to be introduced into the building or structure);

10) detailed architectural designs [drawings showing details of both the architectural exterior and interiors, fire exit/ safety systems [including exits in full compliance with the provisions of R.A. No. 9514 (formerly P.D. No. 1185, otherwise known as the Fire Code of the Philippines), floor and wall patterns, ceiling treatment, roof structure, toilets, kitchens, cabinetry, store and utility rooms, rooms with special functions, stairs, balconies, provisions for disabled end-users (in full accordance with B.P. No. 344, the law on the the enhancement of mobility for disabled persons), architectural interior (AI) perspectives and the like];

11) space plans and furniture/ equipment layouts (drawings showing fixed elements/ furnishings, furniture and equipment positions with respect to the building or structure elements); 

12) architectural specifications (documents which state the finishing materials/ equipment and construction methods to be introduced into the building or structure; such documents may vary from outline through detailed technical versions);

13) architectural cost estimates (documents which state the cost of the architectural elements of a building or structure; such documents range from budgetary through detailed versions);

14) architectural tender (bid) documents (written part of the architectural documents required to bid a building project); and

15) architectural contract documents (written part of the architectural documents detailing the rights, obligations and roles/ responsibilities/ obligations/ liabilities of the building/ project owner, the professionals involved in the planning and design of the building, the general constructor and its sub-constructors/ material suppliers, the project/ construction managers and other parties involved in the building/ project; these architectural documents, together with other such documents prepared by other state-regulated professionals, are annexed to the main construction contract between the building owner and the general constructor). 

2.
What are “building” plans/ designs and documents?

Generally speaking, there are two main classes of documents that make up the “building” plans: 

1) architectural and allied architectural plans/ designs and related documents to be prepared only by registered and licensed architects (RLAs) pursuant to multiple provisions under R.A. No. 9266 (the Architecture Act of 2004); and

2) various engineering layouts/ plans/ designs and related documents to be prepared only by various registered and licensed engineers (professional level) pursuant to provisions under the various engineering professional regulatory laws (PRLs).

There are also between 5 - 12 components or groups of documents that make up a complete set of building plans/ designs and related documents and these are:

1) geodetic survey plans to be prepared only by registered and licensed geodetic engineers in accordance with the special law (PRL) governing the practice of geodetic engineering in the Philippines;

Important Note: While the concerned CEs claim that they can sign and seal architectural documents (outputs by registered and licensed Architects/ RLAs, a separate state-regulated professional), such CEs do not claim that they can also sign and seal geodetic engineering documents (outputs by another state-regulated professional). 
2) architectural plans/ designs/ specifications as enumerated in the previous section and which are to be prepared only by registered and licensed Architects (RLAs) in accordance with the special law (PRL) governing the practice of the state-regulated profession of architecture in the Philippines i.e. R.A. No. 9266, its 2004 IRR and derivative regulations promulgated by the Professional Regulatory Board of Architecture (PRBoA) and/or the Professional Regulation Commission (PRC); 

Very Important Note: The concerned CEs i.e. only the CEs who claim that they can practice architecture, are of the position that they are capable of preparing architectural documents and should therefore be allowed by the DPWH to sign and seal architectural documents i.e. the “A” sheets forming part of the building plans submitted as part of building permit applications. In reality, the concerned CEs mainly rely on persons with some/ limited knowledge of architecture e.g. architecture students, graduates and architecture board exam “flunkers” (and other entities with architectural training and knowledge and who allow themselves to be exploited), to enable and empower the concerned CEs to prepare the architectural documents and to somehow “practice” architecture. This is because the concerned CEs do not possess the training, knowledge, skillsets nor the aptitude to practice architecture. It is even possible that many CEs claiming knowledge of architecture may not even know how to draw or draft architectural drawings. The concerned CEs merely “professionalize” the “architectural” outputs of unregistered persons and illegal practitioners of architecture by their potentially illegal act of signing and sealing such “architectural” outputs and submitting the same to the concerned government offices as “architectural” documents.   

3) structural plans/ designs/ specifications/ computations to be prepared generally by registered and licensed civil engineers (CEs) in accordance with the special law (PRL) governing the practice of civil engineering in the Philippines (mainly R.A. No. 1582 of 1956, which amended R.A. No. 544 of 1950); specialist CEs called structural engineers are often called upon by Architects (RLAs) to undertake the preparation of such plans/ designs;

4) electrical plans/ layouts, designs, specifications and computations to be prepared only by registered and licensed electrical engineers i.e. Professional Electrical Engineers (PEEs) in accordance with the special law (PRL) governing the practice of electrical engineering in the Philippines; 

Important Note: While the concerned CEs claim that they can sign and seal architectural documents (outputs by RLAs, a separate state-regulated professional), such CEs do not claim that they can also sign and seal electrical engineering documents (outputs by PEEs, another state-regulated professional). 
5) mechanical plans/ layouts, designs and specifications [including heating/ ventilation and air-conditioning (HVAC), elevators/ escalators, fire protection system, etc.] to be prepared only by registered and licensed mechanical engineers i.e. Professional Mechanical Engineers (PMEs) in accordance with the special law (PRL) governing the practice of mechanical engineering in the Philippines;

Important Note: While the concerned CEs claim that they can sign and seal architectural documents (outputs by RLAs, a separate state-regulated professional), such CEs do not claim that they can also sign and seal mechanical engineering documents (outputs by PMEs, another state-regulated professional). 
6) plumbing and/ or sanitary plans/ layouts, designs and specifications to be prepared only by registered/ licensed master plumbers and/ or sanitary engineers in accordance with the special laws (PRLs) governing the separate practice of master plumbing and/or sanitary engineering in the Philippines;

Important Note: While the concerned CEs claim that they can sign and seal architectural documents (outputs by RLAs, a separate state-regulated professional), such CEs do not claim that they can also sign and seal plumbing and/or sanitary engineering documents (outputs by other state-regulated professionals). 
7) communications plans/ layouts, designs and specifications to be prepared only by registered and licensed communications engineers (ComEs) in accordance with the special law (PRL) governing the practice of communications engineering (ComE) in the Philippines;

Important Note: While the concerned CEs claim that they can sign and seal architectural documents (outputs by RLAs, a separate state-regulated professional), such CEs do not claim that they can also sign and seal communications engineering documents (outputs by ComEs, another state-regulated professional). 
8) allied architectural plans/ layouts, designs and specifications (including interior designs, furniture designs, landscape architecture designs, acoustic designs, theater design, etc.) to be prepared only by registered and licensed professionals (RLPs) in accordance with the special laws (PRLs) governing the practice of their respective professions in the Philippines (as applicable);

Important Note: While the concerned CEs claim that they can sign and seal architectural documents (outputs by RLAs, a separate state-regulated professional), such CEs do not claim that they can also sign and seal allied architectural documents (outputs by other state-regulated professionals). 
9) civil works plans, designs and specifications to be prepared only by registered and licensed civil engineers (CEs) in accordance with the special law governing the practice of civil engineering in the Philippines (R.A. No. 1582 of 1956, amending R.A. No. 544 of 1950);

10) specialized plans, designs and specifications for other required building systems e.g. kitchen, security, parking management, building automation, information and communications technology (ICT), graphics and signage designs, refrigeration, etc. to be prepared only by registered and licensed professionals (RLPs) or duly-accredited entities in accordance with special laws governing the practice of their respective professions/ expertise in the Philippines and elsewhere;

11) cost estimates and/or quantity surveys/ takeoffs to be prepared only by registered and licensed professionals (RLPs) in accordance with special laws governing the practice of their respective professions in the Philippines;

12) tender (bid) documents to be prepared only by the concerned registered and licensed professionals (RLPs), including lawyers, in accordance with special laws governing the practice of their respective professions in the Philippines; and

13) contract documents for use as support documents to the construction contract, to be prepared only by the concerned RLPs, including lawyers, in accordance with special laws governing the practice of their respective professions in the Philippines.

3.
What is R.A. No. 9266 and what does it say about the practice of Architecture?

The present special law governing the practice of the state-regulated profession of architecture in the Philippines is Republic Act (R.A.) No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004), its 2004 Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR) and derivative regulations periodically promulgated by the PRBoA and/or the PRC. The earlier versions of the law on architecture were R.A. No 545 (the organic law on architecture approved in June 1950) and R.A. No. 1581 (amendment to the 1950 architecture law, approved in June 1956).

The important R.A. No. 9266 provisions are as follows:

3.1 On Architecture in General

SEC. 2. Statement of Policy. - The (Philippine) State recognizes the importance of architects in nation building and development. Hence, it shall develop and nurture competent, virtuous, productive and well-rounded professional architects whose standards of practice and service shall be excellent, qualitative, world-class and globally competitive through inviolable, honest, effective and credible licensure examinations and through regulatory measures, programs and activities that foster their professional growth and development.

SEC. 3. Definition of Terms. - As used in this Act (R.A. No. 9266), the following terms shall be defined as follows:
(1)   "Architecture" is the art, science or profession of planning, designing and constructing buildings in their totality taking into account their environment, in accordance with the principles of utility, strength and beauty;
(2)       "Architect" means a person professionally and academically qualified, registered and licensed under this Act with a Certificate of Registration and Professional Identification Card issued by the Professional Regulatory Board (PRB or “Board”)) of Architecture and the Professional Regulation Commission (PRC), and who is responsible for advocating the fair and sustainable development, welfare and cultural expression of society’s habitat in terms of space, forms and historical context;

(a) 
"Architect-of-record" means the architect registered and licensed under this Act, who is directly and professionally responsible for the total design of the project for the client and who shall assume the civil liability for the plans, specifications and contract documents he/she has signed and sealed;
 (3) 
"General Practice of Architecture" means the act of planning and architectural designing, structural conceptualization, specifying, supervising and giving general administration and responsible direction to the erection, enlargement or alterations of buildings and building environments and architectural design in engineering structures or any part thereof; the scientific, aesthetic and orderly coordination of all the processes which enter into the production of a complete building or structure performed through the medium of unbiased preliminary studies of plans, consultations, specifications, conferences, evaluations, investigations, contract documents and oral advice and directions regardless of whether the persons engaged in such practice are residents of the Philippines or have their principal office or place of business in this country or another territory, and regardless of whether such persons are performing one or all these duties, or whether such duties are performed in person or as the directing head of an office or organization performing them;
(4) 
"Scope of the Practice of Architecture" encompasses the provision of professional services in connection with site, physical and planning and the design, construction, enlargement, conservation, renovation, remodeling, restoration or alteration of a building or group of buildings. xxx . . . xxx;

3.2 On Prohibitions in the Practice of Architecture by Non-Architects (specifically the Civil Engineers) 

SEC. 29. Prohibition in the Practice of Architecture and Penal Clause. - Any person who shall practice or offer to practice architecture in the Philippines without being registered/licensed and who are not holders of temporary or special permits in accordance with the provisions of this Act xxx . . . xxx or otherwise assume, use or advertise any title or description tending to convey the impression that he/she is an architect when he/she is not an architect, or any person whether Filipino or foreigner, who knowingly allows the use, adoption, implementation of plans, designs or specifications made by any person, firm, partnership or company not duly licensed to engage in the practice of architecture, or any person who shall violate any of the provisions of this Act, its implementing rules and regulations, the Code of Ethical Conduct and Standards of Professional Practice, or any policy of the Board and the Commission, shall be guilty of misdemeanor and charged in court by the Commission and shall, upon conviction be sentenced to a fine of not less than One hundred thousand pesos (Pl00,000.00) but not more than Five million pesos (P5,000,000.00) or to suffer imprisonment for a period not less than six (6) months or not exceeding six (6) years, or both, at the discretion of the Court.

SEC. 34. Non-Registered Person Shall Not Claim Equivalent Service. - Persons not registered as an architect shall not claim nor represent either services or work as equivalent to those of a duly qualified registered architect, or that they are qualified for any branch or function of architectural practice, even though no form of the title "Architect" is used.
SEC. 36. Collection of Professional Fees. - It shall be unlawful for any unregistered person to collect a fee for architectural services except as an employee collecting a fee as representative of a Registered Architect. (emphases and underscoring supplied by the PRBoA)

4.
What does R.A. No. 9266 say about architectural documents?

4.1
R.A. No. 9266 Stipulation that only a Registered and Licensed Architect (RLA) shall Prepare, Sign and Seal Architectural Documents

SEC. 20. Seal, Issuance and Use of Seal. - A duly licensed architect shall affix the seal prescribed by the Board bearing the registrant's name, registration number and title "Architect" on all architectural plans, drawings, specifications and all other contract documents prepared by or under his/her direct supervision.

(2) 
No officer or employee of this Republic, chartered cities, provinces and municipalities, now or hereafter charged with the enforcement of laws, ordinances or regulations relating to the construction or alteration of buildings, shall accept or approve any architectural plans or specifications which have not been prepared and submitted in full accord with all the provisions of this Act (R.A. No. 9266); nor shall any payments be approved by any such officer for any work, the plans and specifications for which have not been so prepared and signed and sealed by the author (referring to a registered/ licensed architect).

(5) All architectural plans, designs, specifications, drawings and architectural documents relative to the construction of a building shall bear the seal and signature only of an architect registered and licensed under this Act together with his/her professional identification card number and the date of its expiration.

SEC. 32. Signing of Architectural Plans, Specifications and Other Contract Documents. - XXX . . . and it shall be unlawful for any person, except the Architect-of-record to sign for any branch of the work, or any function or architectural practice, not actually performed by him/her. The Architect-of-record shall be fully responsible for all architectural plans, specifications, and other documents issued under his/her seal or authorized signature.
The Board shall make all the necessary rules and regulations with regards to the signing and sealing of drawings, specifications, reports, and other documents.
SEC. 44. Enforcement of the Act. - It shall be the primary duty of the (Professional Regulation) Commission and the Board (of Architecture) to effectively enforce the provisions of this Act (R.A. No. 9266). All duly constituted law enforcement agencies and officers of national, provincial, city or municipal government or of any political subdivision thereof, shall, upon the call or request of the Commission or the Board, render assistance in enforcing the provisions of this Act and to prosecute any person violating the provisions of the same. The Secretary of Justice or his duly designated representative shall act as legal adviser to the Commission and the Board and shall render legal assistance as may be necessary in carrying out the provisions of this Act.
Any person may bring before the Commission, Board or the aforementioned officers of the law, cases of illegal practice or violations of this Act committed by any person or party.
The Board shall assist the Commission in filing the appropriate charges through the concerned prosecution office in accordance with law and the Rules of Court. (emphases and underscoring supplied by the PRBoA)

Multiple provisions under R.A. No. 9266 which took effect 10 April 2004 and its IRR which took effect 01 December 2004, state that only registered and licensed Architects (RLAs) can prepare, sign and seal architectural documents. 

4.2
Applicable Definitions Under the 2004 R.A. No. 9266 Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR) effective 01 December 2004

Applicable definitions under the 2004 IRR of R.A. No. 9266 which was published 15 November 2004 in Volume 100 No. 46 of the Official Gazette and which took effect 01 December 2004, are as follows:

SEC. 3. Definition of Terms. 
(18) “Architectural Documents” means architectural drawings, specifications, and other outputs of an Architect that only an Architect can sign and seal consisting, among others of vicinity maps, site development plans, architectural program, perspective drawings, architectural floor plans, elevations, sections, ceiling plans, schedules, detailed drawings, technical specifications and cost estimates, and other instruments of service in any form.

(21) “Architectural Plans” means two (2)-dimensional representations reflecting a proposed development/ redevelopment of an enclosed/ semi-enclosed or open area showing features or elements such as columns, walls, partitions, ceiling, stairs, doors, windows, floors, roof, room designation, door and window callouts, the architectural layout of equipment, furnishing, furniture and the like, specifications, callouts, elevation references, drawing references and the like; the architectural plan is the representation of a lateral section for a building/ structure (running parallel to the ground) and at a height of from 1.0 – 1.5 meters above the finished floor; the term may also collectively refer to other architectural designs such as cross/ longitudinal sections, elevations, roof plan, reflected ceiling plan; detailed sections and elevations showing architectural interiors, detailed architectural designs, door and window schedules, other architectural finishing schedules and the like. 

(22) “Building” means a structure for the purpose and function of habitation and other uses.

(26) “Contract Documents” are the documents attached to the agreement identified therein as Contract Documents, including all additions, deletions and modifications incorporated therein. These generally include the following documents:

a) Special Provisions or conditions

b) General Conditions

c) Drawings

d) Specifications

e) Other Bid Documents

4.3
Applicable R.A. No. 9266 IRR Stipulations on National and Local Government Officials in Relation to Architectural Documents

The 2004 IRR of R.A. No. 9266 fully support all the key provisions of R.A. No. 9266 limiting the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents only to Architects registered and licensed under the law i.e. Sections 3, 20, 29, 32, 34, 36, etc. as well as all the key provisions mandating all government employees and officers (national and LGU levels) to enforce R.A. No. 9266 i.e. Sec.20(2), 44, etc.

5.
What does Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) say about architectural documents?

5.1
Stipulation that only an Architect shall Sign and Seal Architectural Documents Under Sec. 302.3 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096  (subject of the 29 January 2008 Decision cum Order that DISSOLVED/ LIFTED the injunction dated 24 May 2005; the 29 January 2008 DISSOLUTION/ LIFTING of the injunction was also AFFIRMED by another Court Order signed 04 May 2009; both the January 2008 and May 2009 Court Orders are IMMEDIATELY EXECUTORY (by all the national and local government officials concerned) in compliance with the Rules of Court and with Philippine jurisprudence, more so since the said provision i.e. Sec. 302.3 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 had already been in effect over the period 01 May through 24 May 2005).
SEC. 302. Application for Permits. (reference Attachment 2) 

1.
Any  person desiring to obtain a building permit xxx . . . xxx shall file applications therefore on the prescribed application forms.

2.
xxx . . . xxx

3. Five (5) sets of survey plans, design plans and specifications and other documents prepared, signed and sealed over the printed names of the duly licensed and registered professionals:

a. xxx . . . xxx;

b. Architect, in case of architectural documents; in case of architectural interior/ interior design documents, either an architect or interior designer may sign;

c. Civil Engineer, in case of civil/ structural documents;

d. xxx . . . xxx. (emphases and underscoring supplied by the PRBoA)
5.2
Listing of Architectural Documents Under Sec. 302.4 (also subject of the 29 January 2008 Decision cum Order that DISSOLVED/ LIFTED the injunction dated 24 May 2005; the 29 January 2008 DISSOLUTION/ LIFTING of the injunction was also AFFIRMED by another Court Order signed 04 May 2009; both the January 2008 and May 2009 Court Orders are immediately executory (by all the national and local government officials concerned), more so since the said provision i.e. Sec. 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 had already been in effect over the period 01 May through 24 May 2005).
Following is a list of architectural documents appearing under Sec. 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 which was already in effect over the period 01 through 24 May 2005. Some of the definitions are omitted for brevity.

4. Architectural Documents  (reference Attachment 2) 

a. Architectural Plans/ Drawings

i. Vicinity Map/ Location Plan . . . xxx.

ii. Site Development Plan . . . xxx.

iii. Perspective . . . xxx.

iv. Floor Plans . . . xxx.

v. Elevations, at least four (4) . . . xxx.

vi. Sections, at least two (2) . . . xxx.

vii. Reflected Ceiling Plan . . . xxx.

viii. Details, in the form of plans, elevations/ sections:

1. xxx

2. xxx 

ix. Schedule of Doors and Windows . . . xxx.

x. Schedule of Finishes . . . xxx.

xi. Details of Other Major Architectural Elements.
b. Architectural Interiors/ Interior Design

i. Space Plan/s or layout/s of architectural interiors.

ii. Architectural interior perspective/s.

iii. Furniture/ furnishing/ equipment/ process layout/s.

iv. Access plan/s, parking plan/s and the like

v. Detail design of major architectural interior elements.

vi. Plan and layout of interior, wall partitions, furnishing, furniture, equipment/ appliances . . . xxx.

vii. Interior wall elevations . . . xxx.

viii. Floor/ ceiling/ wall patterns and finishing details . . . xxx.

ix. List of materials used.

x. Cost estimates.

c. Plans and specific locations of all accessibility facilities . . . xxx.

d. Detailed design of all such accessibility facilities outside and around buildings/ structures . . . xxx.

e. Fire Safety Documents

i. xxx

ii. xxx 

f. Other related documents. (emphases and underscoring supplied by the PRBoA)
6.
What has the Philippine Government done to Address the CE claim that they too can prepare architectural documents? 

The civil engineers (CEs) are of the position that Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines (NBCP) purportedly allows CEs (by/ as themselves) to also sign and seal architectural plans, designs and specifications and that the said provision should be retained i.e. status quo. 

This supposed/ alleged provision of P.D. No. 1096 never existed as confirmed by officially certified documents issued on several occasions by the Malacañang Records Office, the repository of all documents emanating from the Office of the President i.e. Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 as signed in February 1977 by then President Ferdinand E. Marcos never stated that CEs can sign nor seal architectural documents; the Malacañang Records Office also certified in June 2009 that the text of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 had remained unchanged since its 1977 promulgation; as such,  Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096 could not be revised nor amended by mere executive issuances such as the supposed DPWTC Ministry Order No. 57, a mere ministry executive order which does not have the power of law nor the power to amend any portion of P.D. No. 1096. 

The matter of this “clearly illegal insertion/ intercalation” in Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096, supposedly allowing CEs to sign and seal architectural documents was therefore corrected by the DPWH through Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR, effective over the period 01 through 24 May 2005) of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines (NBCP), which was fully harmonized by the DPWH in 2004 with the multiple provisions of R.A. No. 9266 which limit the preparation, signing and sealing of architectural documents only to registered and licensed architects (RLAs).

Compared to the special professional regulatory laws (PRLs) i.e. R.A. No. 9266 of 2004, which repealed R.A. No. 1582 of 1956 and R.A. No. 545 of 1950, P.D. No. 1096 (the 1977 NBCP) is considered a general law inasmuch as it addresses all professional disciplines that are involved in the preparation of building plans and designs. 

Sections 302.3 and 302.4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096, while the subject of an already dissolved/ lifted 2005 injunction issued by the Court on the basis of potential misrepresentations and the incorrect invocation of legal bases (specifically the CEs’ intercalated version of Sec. 302 of P.D. No. 1096), aside from completely ignoring laws on the practice of architecture, is merely a listing of documents required to support an application for a building permit application. The questioned sections do not specifically cover the matter of the state-regulated practice of the profession of architecture i.e. covered by R.A. No. 9266 for Architects (RLAs) and R.A. No. 1582 (the amended R.A. No. 544 of the CEs). 

Prior to R.A. No. 9266’s approval on 17 March 2004, the Department of Justice (DoJ) (upon the CEs representation with the DPWH in late 2003), conducted a close scrutiny of the civil engineering law (R.A. No. 544 of 1950, as amended by R.A. No. 1582 of 1956) and compared the same with the organic and amended architecture laws (R.A. No. 545 and R.A. No. 1581).  The DoJ comparison resulted in a very interesting and decades-overdue interpretation that clearly and unequivocably stated that only Architects/ RLAs shall sign and seal architectural documents. The DoJ opinion should have finally settled the CEs’ long-held claim once and for all i.e. that CEs by themselves are supposedly allowed under Philippine law to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents. Both the DoJ legal opinion dated 09 January 2004 and the multiple provisions of R.A. No. 9266 have thereafter been used as the legal bases for harmonizing Secs. 302.3 and 302.4 under the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096, the 1977 NBCP. 

CEs by themselves cannot prepare, sign and seal architectural documents as nowhere is it stated in their law (R.A. No. 1582 and R.A. No. 544) that they are allowed to prepare such documents. Neither is it stated under their law that the CEs can prepare, sign and seal other types of engineering deliverables e.g. mechanical, electrical, sanitary, communications plans/ designs/ specifications, etc.,  although these likewise form part of “building“ plans. In fact, the major amendatory provision under Sec. 25 of R.A. No. 1582 explicitly segregates the practices and liabilities of the CE and the Architect in a project/ firm.

The term “plans and specifications” in R.A. No. 1582 and R.A. No. 544 pertains mainly to civil engineering services (including “buildings” forming part of engineering structures) and quite possibly even for buildings for public gatherings only but not/ never to architectural plans and designs for all other types of buildings nor to architectural and other recognized engineering services for that matter. R.A. No. 9266, a special law, also repeals provisions in the CE law/s that are in conflict with R.A. No. 9266. Hence, CEs by themselves cannot and must not sign and seal architectural plans, designs and specifications. 

After harmonizing Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 NBCP) with the multiple provisions of R.A. No. 9266 that limit to registered and licensed architects (RLAs) the privilege of preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents, the DPWH promulgated the same in October 2004, with the DPWH publishing the same nationally in April 2005, rendering the same effective by 01 May 2005 (and in effect until the issuance of the injunction secured by the PICE in late May 2005. 

With the 29 January 2008 Decision cum Court Order lifting/ dissolving the said injunction (which was immediately executory under the Rules of Court and under Philippine jurisprudence), Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 NBCP) should have been implemented by all national and local government officials without qualification. The said Court Order was affirmed by another Court order signed 04 May 2009. Again, Secs. 302.3 & 4 of the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (1977 NBCP) must now be implemented by all national and local government officials without qualification.
The Philippine CE registration and license were never and will never be a license to practice the two (2) regulated professions of civil engineering and architecture!  Nor are CEs allowed by their law to practice other regulated professions allied to architecture (interior design, landscape architecture, environmental planning) nor the other state-regulated engineering professions!

7.
Are CEs qualified at all to prepare architectural documents?

When CEs gain the right to practice civil engineering after passing their licensure examination, their license does not cover architectural practice as nowhere in the subjects of their licensure examination is architectural plan preparation and design nor site planning included. Contrast this with the Licensure Examination for Architects (LEA), which is one hundred percent (100%) about the planning and design of buildings and their environs. The same cannot be said about the CE licensure examinations where the structural design for buildings is only a fraction of the total subjects for examination. 

In all likelihood, Philippine CEs would not have a single academic unit of architecture in their 181-unit course and quite possibly a maximum of only 14 units (7.7% of total courses taken) touching on structural design of buildings/ structures. In stark contrast, the B.S. Architecture graduate would have taken at least seventy seven (77) academic units of mainstream architecture courses aside from another twenty seven (27) units in the engineering and allied design fields (for a total of 104 units or 57.5% of the B.S. Architecture course devoted exclusively to the planning and design of buildings and their environs). 

Unlike architecture graduates, the graduate CE students also do not undergo a two (2)-year apprenticeship period under practicing Mentor-Architects/ RLAs (covering building plan and design preparation) prior to taking their Licensure Examination for Architects (LEA). 
All told, Philippine CEs fail to satisfy the three (3) elemental requisites to practice architecture in the Philippines: 1) a B.S. Architecture degree; 2) a two (2)-year immersion in diversified training related to the architectural planning, design and construction of buildings; and 3) an Architect’s Certificate of Registration and an Architect’s identification (ID) card i.e. a renewable license, all issued by the Professional Regulation Commission (PRC) only after the aspiring architects successfully hurdle the LEA.

Philippine CEs have therefore not been academically prepared, have not been sub-professionally trained/ prepared (for 2 full years prior to taking the LEA) and have not passed the state licensure examination for Architects (LEA). Clearly, CEs by themselves are not qualified under law to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents nor to render any regulated form of architectural services.  

8.
What background, training and skillset/s are required to prepare architectural documents?

The following are universally recognized as standard architectural documents or deliverables/ outputs prepared, signed and sealed by Architects/ RLAs in the Philippine setting and the minimum training and skillset required to prepare such documents:

1) exterior perspective requires a lecture course in manual perspective drawing and subsequent training in applicable software;

2) site development plan requires up to six (6) units of lecture courses on physical planning and subsequent training in applicable software;

3) floor plans, sections, elevations, reflected ceiling plans, roof plans, schedules of doors and windows, schedules of finishes, fixtures and hardware and the like requires parts of up to ten (10) full laboratory courses plus up to twelve (12) lecture courses in pre-design preparation and architectural plan and design preparation and subsequent training in applicable software plus a mandatory two (2)-year diversified training;

4) detailed architectural designs and full compliances with P.D. No. 1096 (1977 NBCP), R.A. No. 9514, repealing P.D. No. 1185 (Fire Code) and B.P. No. 344 (Law on the Mobility of Disabled Persons and their respective IRRs requires parts of up to ten (10) full laboratory courses plus up to twelve (12) lecture courses in pre-design preparation and architectural plan and design preparation and subsequent training in applicable software plus a mandatory two (2)-year diversified training;

5) space plans and furniture/ equipment layouts, architectural specifications, architectural cost estimates requires parts of up to twelve (12) lecture courses, subsequent training in applicable software plus a mandatory two (2)-year diversified training; and

6) architectural tender (bid) documents, architectural contract documents requires parts of up to twelve (12) lecture courses and subsequent training in applicable software plus a mandatory two (2)-year diversified training.

9.
Why should registered and licensed Architects (RLAs) be the only state-regulated professionals to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents?

Multiple provisions under the Republic Act or R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004) are very clear in stating that only registered and licensed Architects (RLAs) shall sign and seal any and all architectural plans, specifications and related contract documents (there are no ifs and buts and those who persist in the illegal practice of architecture must be ready to face the consequences under said law).  Under Section 29, the penalties for the criminal violation of R.A. No. 9266 may range from PhP One Hundred Thousand (P100,000.00) to PhP Five Million (P5,000,000.00) or imprisonment of from six (6) months to six (6) six years or a combination of both. 
The structural design of buildings is a specific subject in the licensure examination for architects (LEA) from 1950 through 2004, where examinees are required to compute sizes and reinforcements of the structural elements in a building. Therefore those who pass the LEA from 1950 through 2004 have also gained the legal and inalienable right to prepare structural plans and designs, basically for small buildings/ structures (say 1 – 4 or 5 storeys). Yet in a modus vivendi with the CEs (apparently in exchange for CE support for R.A. No. 9266), the official representatives of Philippine Architects/ RLAs agreed to limit the Architects’ work to architectural plan/ design preparation and to do mere conceptual structural design i.e. where the Architects/ RLAs shall only indicate or suggest the locations and architectural configurations of structural supports, reserving the structural computations, structural design analysis and structural drawings to CEs or the specialist CEs i.e. structural engineers. This agreement was apparently intended to sustain the harmonious relationship among regulated professionals so that there shall be no more overlapping of roles in the building trade and construction industry. 

While this arrangement has already been enshrined in R.A. No. 9266 i.e. the Architects/ RLAs gave up structural design of small buildings/ structures, many CEs still maintain their desire to practice architecture by preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents. If the Architects/ RLAs agree to what the said CEs want, the Architects/ RLAs would have lost their right to practice limited structural design in exchange for nothing. 

The intention of the CE laws (R.A. No. 1582 and R.A. No. 544) and the repealed architecture laws (R.A. No. 1581 and R.A. No. 545) are clear in that civil structures (or buildings of a purely engineering nature) and some buildings for public gatherings are for registered/ licensed CEs to plan and design (but excluding architectural plan and design preparation) while other structures, particularly buildings which are settings for habitation or various indoor-outdoor human (or other) activities and which require the academic orientation, the sub-professional training and the professional expertise/ knowhow of registered and licensed Architects (RLAs), are solely for RLAs to plan and design. Again, nowhere is it stated in either law that CEs by themselves can prepare architectural plans, designs, specifications and related contract documents.

10.
What does it take to become a Registered and Licensed Architect (RLA) in the Philippines?

The preparation of architectural plans, designs and specifications require stock knowledge and high-value skillsets of a broad menu of architectural specializations that are first taught and learned only in architectural schools, to wit: 

1) the arts and humanities for architecture students; 

2) the social sciences for architecture students; 

3) space planning/ management;

4) anthropometrics; 

5) metrication; 

6) architectural and site programming (including space-time-motion studies); 

7) architectural elements and composition (including scale and proportion);

8) architectural concepts, practices and history; 

9) architectural design theories (including the psychology of space); 

10) the use and psychology of color; 

11) tropical and environmental design; 

12) international graphic and design standards for architecture and site planning (including knowledge of architectural drafting conventions/ techniques); 

13) building types; 

14) architectonics and structural design for buildings;

15) architectural specification writing (specifically including the type/ quality/ behavior/ appropriateness of finishing materials/ processes);

16) architectural interiors; 

17) architectural lighting and acoustics; 

18) end-user security and safety; 

19) planning and building laws;

20) site development planning; 

21) urban design; 

22) building utility systems; 

23) project coordination (which requires a broad understanding of allied professional services including all the engineering disciplines related to building design/ interior design/ landscape architecture/ environmental planning); 

24) contract documentation; 

25) architectural ethics and responsibilities of the architect; 

26) visualization/ perspective/ rendering/ model construction and presentation techniques; 

27) the language of architecture and architectural drawing/ drafting; 

28) professional laws and ethics;

29) design for disabled persons; and

30) a host of other specializations and sub-specializations which Philippine CEs do not possess simply because they were never trained nor officially examined by the state to become Architects/ RLAs.
It was never easy becoming an Architect/ RLA in the Philippines because the aspiring architecture student/ graduate must study/ train to be an Architect and at the same time to understand the work of engineers and allied professionals i.e. to someday become the master builder (the English translation of the ancient Greek word “architekton”), the one, true and prime building professional and the official representative/ protector of the Clients’ interests. 

Philippine Architects have also not been trained nor are they allowed under R.A. No. 9266 (and earlier architecture laws) to be Constructors/ Developers and that is why their loyalty to their Clients, to the upholding of public interest and to their profession and their professional ethics largely remain unquestioned.

11.
What is the effect of allowing CEs to sign and seal architectural documents?

While it is much faster to become a CE in this country i.e. possibly more than one hundred and twenty thousand (120,000) registered CEs (of which about 80,000 are registered and licensed CEs) as compared to only twenty four thousand five hundred (24,500) registered Architects (RAs, of which about 14,000 are registered and licensed architects/ RLAs) to date, the said situation does not mean that registered and licensed CEs can also practice as registered and licensed Architects (RLAs) simply because of their vastly superior number and the implied capability to service more clients. This only means that CEs outnumber Architects/ RLAs because it is so much faster (and requires less material resources) to become a registered CE than to become a registered/ licensed Architect in the Philippines. Again however, we have to stress the fact that the three (3) primary requirements under R.A. No. 545 and R.A. No. 1581 and under R.A. No. 9266 for one to qualify for practice as an Architect/ RLA are qualifications which CEs simply do not, and possibly cannot/ can never possess. 

The many thousands of CEs moonlighting as Architects/ RLAs and the assumption of the Offices of the Municipal/ City Engineers of the parallel/ simultaneous functions of the Office of the Building Official since 1991 (by virtue of the implementation of R.A. No. 7160 (the Local Government Code) are two (2) of the major causes of the generally poor quality of Philippine building and housing plans/ designs since such CEs involved in such projects may not completely comprehend and may not be competent to do the work of registered/ licensed Architects (RLAs) and yet they continue to practice as ”Architects” and even go to the extent of officially approving architectural documents prepared, signed and sealed by fellow CEs under their very mistaken and possibly blind belief that their CE laws (R.A. No. 1582 and R.A. No. 544) allow them to prepare architectural documents i.e. the primary component of the practice of architecture as defined under all architectural laws passed from 1950 through 2004.  

Interestingly, the acknowledged father of both R.A. No. 7160 and R.A. No. 9266, the good Senator Aquilino Q. Pimentel, Jr., has consistently maintained the primacy and sole vested right of the Architects/ RLAs to the acts of preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents. 

Among the common practices violative of P.D. No. 1096, otherwise known as the 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines (NBCP) and that are generally ascribed to some CEs, quite possibly due to their apparent lack of understanding of architecture and environmental/ urban design are : 

1)
operable windows on firewalls; 

2)
non-compliance with setback and yard requirements; 

3)
inclusion or appropriation of portions of public areas such as sidewalks in completed construction projects; 

4)
constricted parking and driveway/ ramp spaces if these are provided at all; 

5)
non-application of tropical design and environmentally-enhancing/ mitigating features for buildings and grounds (including the absolute lack or destruction of trees or plant material and the general lack of open, unpaved ground that allows for surface water percolation); 

6)
construction outside property limits; 

7)
poor finishing material selection/ specification resulting in physical damage to property or discomfort to end-users; 

8)
lack of properly-planned fire escape systems; 

9)
poorly positioned/ sited or poorly sized/ proportioned signages or signage structures that cause distraction, urban blight/ visual clutter and pollution, and which pose a constant danger to the general public; and 

10)
a host of other common violations.  

Many CEs practicing architecture are also apparently quite deficient in their knowledge of the provisions of B.P. No. 344 (Accessibility Law) which mandates plan/ design provisions for the disabled sector, both inside and outside buildings/ structures and of the required compliances with the Fire Code (R.A. No. 9514, formerly P.D. No. 1185).   

Such commonplace violations should not be foisted on the unsuspecting public whose very lives are potentially compromised by allowing such CEs to sign and seal improperly prepared architectural documents without the benefit of a registered and licensed Architect (RLA)’s participation/ scrutiny.  

12.
What should be the resolution of the issue of sole professional signatory to architectural documents?

The highly irregular and potentially illegal practice of Philippine civil engineers (CEs) preparing, signing and sealing architectural documents (plans, designs, specifications, etc.) must end now!  
It is not only the prudent thing to do but it shall be fully compliant/ consistent with the following:

1) 
the January 29, 2008 and May 04, 2009 Court Orders (in the case which the CEs themselves filed against the DPWH); the said Court Orders are all immediately executory by all national and local government officials notwithstanding any CE-initiated motion for reconsideration or review; the full compliance with the Orders by all entities in both the private and public sectors is thus required by the Court in accordance with the Rules of Court and with Philippine jurisprudence; otherwise, indirect contempt charges can be filed by any RLA at the lower courts against any one who refuses to comply; 

2)  the multiple provisions under R.A. No. 9266 (The Architecture Act of 2004, which the CEs themselves helped to craft over the period 2002-2004); and 

3)
the 2004 DoJ opinion (sought by the CEs themselves through the DPWH). 

P.D. No. 1096 (The 1977 National Building Code of the Philippines/ NBCP) is also a general (and older) law that must defer to the stipulations of the specific (and more recent/ special) law i.e. R.A. No. 9266. Moreover, R.A. No. 1582 and R.A. No. 544 (the civil engineering law/s) is a 53 to 59 year old law and may not anymore be attuned to the requirements of modern-day building projects, which have become more complex and therefore requires very specialized skill sets from the engaged state-regulated professionals. 

After more than a half century, the pertinent laws have finally been harmonized to correct the perennial injustice suffered by Philippine Architects/ RLAs. The three (3) co-equal branches of the Philippine government have already spoken clearly, unequivocably and in unison in full support of the Architects/ RLAs i.e. that only Architects/ RLAs shall prepare, sign and seal architectural documents. 
These are: 1) the legislative and executive branches through their approval of R.A. No. 9266, 2) the executive branch through the IRR of R.A. No. 9266 (effective 01 December 2004), the 2004 Revised IRR of P.D. No. 1096 (effective 01 May 2005), various new laws pertaining to the procurement of architectural services for public sector projects and the January 2004 DoJ legal opinion; and 3) the judiciary through the January 29, 2008 Decision cum Order and May 4, 2009 Order of the Manila RTC Branch 22 and the  recent Quezon City RTC Order dismissing the claim of some CEs that they too can sign and seal architectural documents. 

Philippine Architects/ RLAs have always respected the profession of civil engineering and Philippine CEs. However, what some CEs have for the profession of Architecture and for Philippine Architects/ RLAs now appears to be much less than respect. Philippine CEs and RLAs can co-exist and continue to collaborate but such a co-existence should be based on mutual respect and compliance with the dictates of law.   
In fact, in a project setting, the Architects/ RLAs only demand that they prepare, sign and seal architectural documents in full conformity with Philippine law. The CEs are free to do all of the other activities in a project setting ranging from structural to civil works engineering plan/ design preparation to actual project implementation where the CEs either function as the constructor, sub-constructor or as the project or construction manager.

The CEs have no other excuse except their bullheadedness and misguided notion that they are the “prime professional” for buildings. Architectural documents are the primary components of the building plan as everything else is derived from the architectural plan/ design.  Architectural documents can only be properly prepared by natural persons who have been academically, sub-professionally trained, state-examined and professionally educated/ developed to perform the role of a RLA.

There is clearly no overlap in the practices of the CEs and the Architects/ RLAs. The supposed overlap only exists in the minds of CEs. It is crystal clear from the foregoing discussions that CEs are not professionally qualified to prepare, sign and seal architectural documents as they lack the requisite academic preparation, sub-professional training nor the required professional education and development.  More importantly, the differently-trained/ oriented/ abled CEs do not, cannot and quite possibly never comply with the minimum requisites to lawfully practice architecture in the Philippines.   

The CEs must finally abide with the true spirit and intent of the laws of the land and leave the practice of the separate state-regulated profession of architecture to the Architects/ RLAs! The Philippine Government (at both the national and local levels) must continue to compel the CEs to comply with the dictates of law. The CEs and their willing/ ardent supporters in government are not above the law and must perforce comply with its dictates or suffer the consequences of their actions! The law may be harsh but it is the law!  
Attachments follow.
